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Mrs. R. L. Mathis

TWELFTHPRESIDENTWOMAN’SMISSIONARYUNIOI
Alma Hunt

rpRADITlONALLY a newly- 
elected president is introduced 

through Royal Service. Our presi­
dent, elected June 10, 1969, in New 
Orleans, needs no introduction to 
Woman’s Missionary Union or to 
the Southern Baptist Convention, 
the Baptist World Alliance Women’s 
Department, or even the Baptist 
World Alliance. I cannot prove my 
statement, but still I am willing to 

risk saying there is no Baptist woman 
in the world more widely known and 
more generally beloved than our new 
president. Mrs. R. L. Mathis.

Mrs. Mathis needs no introduc­
tion to Woman's Missionary Union 
because she served as our president 
from 1956 through our 75th Anni­
versary meeting in 1963. She needs 
no introduction to the Southern Bap­
tist Convention because she was the 

first woman in its history elected to 
a Convention office. In the 1963 
meeting—just after she brought to 
a close her term as WMU pi evident 
—she was elected second vice presi­
dent of the Convention. She needs 
no introduction to Baptist women of 
the world because she has been 
treasurer of the BWA Woman’s De­
partment for nine years ano m con­
nection with this office ha^ cen in

meetings of Baptist women on every 
continent. And she needs no intro­
duction to the Baptist World Alli­
ance because currently she is serving 
as a vice president of the Alliance. 
She is the only woman officer and is 
the first woman appointed chairman 
of the program committee. She is 
chairman of the international com­
mittee planning the program for the 
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twelfth Baptist World Congress to 
be held in Tokyo, Japan, July 12-18, 
1970.

Signal honors have been conferred 
on Mrs. Mathis. We do not call her 
Doctor, but we could. Hardin-Sim­
mons made her the first woman re­
cipient of an honorary degree from 
that university by conferring a doc­
tor of laws degree in 1955. Mary-

Hardin Baylor College with its long 
history conferred its first honorary 
degree on a woman, doctor of liter­
ature, on Mrs. Mathis in 19S5, also. 
The Liberian government, during the 
meeting of the BWA Executive 
Committee there in 1968, conferred 
on her the highest knighthood degree 
in the Liberian Humane Order of 
African Redemption. |



Mrs. R. L. Mathis

Mrs. Mathis has the ability to 
maintain her poise while having her 
fingers in many pies. For six years 
she has been director of the Promo­
tion Division of the WMU head­
quarters staff in Birmingham. This 
position placed her on many com­
mittees within the Southern Baptist 
Convention. Because of her creative 
mind and her ability to shoulder re­
sponsibility, other jobs seem to have 
gravitated toward her. At present 
she is focusing her near vision on 
Mission 70—a missions conference 
for students and young adults to be 
held in Atlanta, Georgia, December 
28-31, 1969—sponsored by the 
Foreign Mission Board, the Home 
Mission Board, the Sunday School 
Board, the Brotherhood Commis­
sion, and Woman’s Missionary 
Union. Her far vision is focused on 

the platform presentation of the 
125th Anniversary of the Southern 
Baptist Convention in Denver, Colo­
rado, in June 1970, for which she 
is serving as committee chairman.

One might be tempted to wrap up 
a description of Mrs. Mathis by ap­
plying the adage “All work and no 
play"—that is, if thgit one could for­
get the remainder of the adage: 
“makes Jack a dull boy.” Behind 
the scenes Mrs. Mathis is a hard 
worker but she’s never dull. Her 
sparkling personality shines through 
when the going is rough. She ap­
pears tireless when responsibility de­
mands unremitting toil. She is never 
more winsome than when helping 
someone. She is never more attrac­
tive than when she is in the com­
pany of her daughter, Jane; her son- 
in-law, Cleo Coffey, Jr.; and her 
grandsons, eighteen-year-old Danny 
and twelve-year-old Bobby. Mrs. 
Mathis’ husband died in 1946.

Mrs. Mathis came to the WMU 
staff in 1963 with a rich background 
of experience in WMU and in the 
Convention. Professionally she had 
been youth secretary and executive 
secretary for the Texas WMU, di­
rector of church activities on the 
staff of the First Baptist Church, 
Dallas, Texas, and director of the 
Student Union at Baylor University. 
Also she had served as president of 
Texas WMU 1949-55, member of 
the Foreign Mission Board, and 
member of the executive board of 

the Baptist General Convention of 
Texas.

Earlier I stated that signal honon 
had come to Mrs. Mathis. One was 
in 1956 when she was chosen by the 
nominating committee as the nomi­
nee for the presidency of Woman’s 
Missionary Union. Even that did not 
say all that her nomination in June 
1969 said. The nominating com­
mittee was composed of the stale 
WMU presidents in the twenty-sis 
state conventions large enough to 
have representation on our nomina­
ting committee. Some years ago the 
bylaws committee recommended this 
composition of the committee be­
cause these women have opportun­
ity to know leaders from across die 
Convention territory as no other 
group. These twenty-six leaders felt 
guided by the Holy Spirit to place 
Mrs. Mathis’ name in nomination 
for our president. To be brought 
back to the presidency underscores 
the confidence of Woman’s Mission­
ary Union in her as a person and as 

our leader.
Mrs. Mathis will live in Waco, 

Texas, and direct the Student Union 
at Baylor University—the profes­
sional position she combined with 
the presidency of Woman’s Mission­
ary Union from 1956-63. In a sense, 
history may be repeating itself; but 
Woman’s Missionary Union cannot 
move backward under the forward 
vision which always characterizes the 
leadership of Mrs. R. L. Mathis.

No Time To Be 
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In
By choice, Mrs. Robert Fling 

brought to a close her tenure as 
president of Woman’s Missionary 
Union with the Annual Meeting in 
New Orleans, June 9-10, 1969. She 
had a conviction that she should 
free herself of responsibility which 
demanded her being away from her 
home as much as the presidency did. 
This conviction grew after her hus­
band answered the call to a new 
field of service. With thirty-five 
years of experience in pastorates in 
Texas. Louisiana, and Oklahoma. 
Mr. Fling received appointment by 
the Home Mission Board as pastor­
director in Westchester County, New 
York. In so doing, he accepted the 
call of the Westchester Baptist 
Church in Hartsdale. New York— 
a new church composed of about 
fifty vigorous members whose homes 
are scattered over a radius of more 
than thirty-five miles. Mr Fling’s 
double title spells out a dream He 
is pastor of what the Home Mission 
Board and the Flings dream will 
become the mother church in West­
chester County of many missions 
and churches

Mrs. Fling has given unreservedly 
of herself to the office of president 
Her high quality of leadership was 
felt in Executive Board meetings, 
in messages to WML' Annual Meet­
ings. to state WML’ meetings, and 
to the Southern Baptist Convention 
This quality of leadership has been 
reflected also in her writing which 
will continue to bring benefit to 
Woman’s Missionary Union Though 
she has retired from the presidency. 
Mrs Fling has earned a place in our 
hearts which will continue to be hers

—Alma Hunt
Executive Secretary
Woman's Missionary Union

During a WMU Executive Board dinner. Dr. Porter Routh, executive secretary­
treasurer of the Southern Baptist Convention Executive Committee, called atten­
tion to such traits of leadership as understanding, strong convictions, insight, 
humility, and compassion demonstrated by Mrs. Fling during her term of office

...NBW

Helen Fling epitomizes the quali­
ties I have observed in WMU lead­
ership WMU leadership has been 
gracious and creatively efficient has 
shown a breadth of vision that has 
seen the total work of Baptist people 
rather than a few isolated concerns 
and has shown a quality of courage 
that is gentle and gracious as well as 
indestructible W MU members leave 
such delightful frxvtprints

—Dr Baker James Cauthen 
Executive Secretary 
Foreign Mission Board

TO.nWYAND

Mrs [ ling is a partner in missions 
with the Home Mission Board As 
she assists her husband, pastor-di­
rector of the Westchester Baptist 
( hurch. Westchester Counts, ^cw 
>ork she has never met a problem 
that she has not been willing to face 
There is eternity in her deeds be­
cause of her unique wav of ex­
pressing love for Christ

Dr 1 O Griffith
Direttor f)ni\ion of Com­

munication
Home Mission Board
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Catherine Allen

FOR twelve years the name 

Ethalee Hamric has appeared in this 
magazine as editor. For the first time 
in 149 issues there is no Ethalee on 
the masthead of Royal Service.

If you could search the Woman’s 
Missionary Union office building in 
Birmingham, you would find Ma­
dame Editor in her same Oriental- 
accented office, steadily wearing 
down a ceramic pot full of sharp­
ened pencils, shuffling stacks of 
manuscripts, and scrutinizing print­
ers' schedules.

But the fruit of her editorial labors 
is no longer to be monthly issues of 
Royal Service. She is busy bring­
ing into being a lively new offspring 
of Royal Service. The new maga­
zine, one of a family of seven to 
be published by WML' beginning in 
October 1970. is named Dimension.

The proud editor talks about her 
production:

"Dimension is a WMU magazine 
—the first one we have ever had 
It belongs to all facets of WMU 
work.

"Dimension is for the WMU di­
rector, assistant director, secretary. 

and age-level directors. It will help 
WMU officers in their work on the 
WMU council.

“This new magazine will guide an 
age-level director's work with her 
age-level council. It will guide the 
WMU director in her work with the 
church council, the pastor, and the 
Brotherhood director.

"You might call Dimension a utili­
tarian piece. It will look useful and 
be useful—like a well-written recipe 
—easy to follow.

"A WMU officer can get the spe­
cifics of her job from Dimension, but 
she will also get articles and features 
which will help her to be a better 
Christian, a more effective leader, 
and a better informed supporter of 
missions.

"The new magazine will have the 
same size pages as Royal Service 
—approximately 8*/a by 11 inches. 
It will be published quarterly. The 
first copy will be dated October 
1970. but it will have its debut at 
Glorieta and Ridgecrest WMU Con­
ferences in the summer of 1970.”

For about seventy-five years, one 
set of officers and one magazine.

Royal Service, served both WMU 
and WMS. But as WMU grew, the 
work of the general organization 
began to take on a personality dis­
tinctive from the adult organization. 
Churches began to elect WMU offi­
cers as well as WMS officers.

Royal Service offered WMU 
officers specialized help in Fore­
caster And in anticipation of the 
1968 WMU reorganization, Royal 
Service launched a leader section 
called The WMU Leader.

No person has witnessed the evo­
lution of WMU and its new maga­
zine more closely than Ethalee 
Hamric And no person has con­
tributed more to the growth and de­
velopment of the organization than 
she has.

This Alabama native took her 
first WMU job in the early 1940's 
while she had the summer off from 
schoolteaching. She served as sec­
retary to the WMU editorial secre­
tary, Miss Juliette Mather—a sum­
mer job that stretched into almost 
two years After experience on a 
church staff in Anniston, Alabama, 

she moved to the Baptist Sunday 
School Board to serve on the staff 
of Home Life. In time off from 
Home Life, she studied journalism 
at Northwestern University.

Miss Mather lured Ethalee back 
to Birmingham and WMU in 1948 
to serve as managing editor of the 
WMU youth magazines. Between 
deadlines she earned a master of 
arts in English at Peabody College, 
in 1955 she became editor of The 
Window of YWA. When Miss 
Mather resigned in 1957, Ethalee 
succeeded her as editor of Royal 
Service.

Evidence of Ethalee Hamric’s 
skill as an editor has been the steady 
rise in the circulation of Royal 
Service. In 1956 subscribers num­
bered 300,000. After ten years, the 
circulation had climbed to 492,696.

Commenting upon this increase 
in subscriptions, Ethalee stated

"The audience is the main factor 
I have tried to keep in mind. I 
hoped to tie the magazine to the in­
terests of a wide range of women. 
I have thought of Royal Service 

readers as women most like the 
women in my city church or those 
in my sister's rural church.”

When Dimension comes to the 
WMU officers’ rescue in 1970, 
Royal Service, for the first time, 
will concentrate solely on the adult 
women who have been its main audi­
ence since its founding in 1914. 
Every member and leader of Baptist 
Women (as WMS will be called) 
will need her own copy. Royal 
Service will continue to inform its 
readers of events in world missions 
and provide meeting guidance for 
Baptist Women

Ethalee says of her new editing 
adventure:

"No job is more interesting to me 
than editing I'm fortunate that I 
found the job that suits me. As a 
Sunbeam, like many other children, 
I was going to be a missionary. 
When I grew up, 1 didn’t feel a call 
to missionary appointment. Then, I 
learned the satisfaction of doing 
something for missions in the work 
of editing "
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UTHER RICE WILKINS, a 
Confederate soldier, killed at 

Fort Donelson." This brief item was 
almost lost among the other details 
my father had written about his fam­
ily history. The name Luther Rice 
turned on the ignition of my imagi­
nation, and the motor slipped into 
high gear supplying the missing 
background. My great-grandparents 
must have admired the brilliant 
bachelor preacher very much to 
have named their son for him. Per­
haps the tireless traveler had often 
left his horse Columbus in their 
barn and spent the night in their 
East Tennessee home. Maybe they 
had listened along with the hun­
dreds of others to his moving ac­
count of the Burman mission, his 

persuasive plea tor offerings to sup­
port both missions and education, 
and his intelligent prayer for Baptist 
work everywhere. If he had indeed 
been a houseguest, they were un­
doubtedly warmed by his singing, 
his conduct of family worship, and 
by his intercession for each member 
of the household by name.

During his lifetime, Luther Rice 
was both admired and vilified, loved 
and hated. Today we consider him 
a great Baptist statesman whose 
“feet of clay” were primarily an un­
realistic optimism and a lack of sub­
mission to the disciplines of the 
democratic process. His ideas were 
excellent; but he tended to rush 
headlong into giving these ideas sub­
stance without being properly au-

with Southern
Followers

thonzed.
Luther Rice was one of the first 

five missionaries from the United 
States. In 1812, along with Adoni- 
ram Judson and three others. Rice 
was appointed by the Congrega- 
tionalists as a missionary to India. 
He and the Judsons accepted the 
Baptist view of baptism, joined a 
Baptist church, and consequently 
resigned as Congregationalist mis­
sionaries. Rice returned to America 
in 1813 to solicit support for him­
self and the Judsons from the Bap­
tists He so inspired the Baptists to 
missions concern that missionary so­
cieties were formed almost every­
where he spoke.

Not long after his return from 
India. Rice conceived of a national

Baptist organization for fostering 
missions which would be composed 
of representatives of missionary so­
cieties and other interested bodies. 
He shared this dream with Baptist 
leaders, both north and south. The 
immediate result of this plan was 
the formation in 1814 of the Gen­
eral Missionary Convention of the 
Baptist Denomination in the United 
States of America for Foreign Mis­
sions—a name usually abbreviated 
to the Triennial Convention because 
the organization met every three 
years. Rice was appointed the agent 
of the Convention to organize so­
cieties and to secure money for mis­
sions.

Luther Rice was well educated, 
having studied at Williams College 
and Andover Seminary. After he 
began working with Baptists, he 
became appalled at the low educa­
tional level of many of our preach­
ers and even the illiteracy of others. 
He became convinced that the fu­
ture of missions was dependent upon 
an educated leadership, both of mis­
sionaries and pastors.

Kate Wilkins Woolley

Largely at Rice's insistence the 
Triennial Convention of 1817 
amended its constitution to establish 
"a classical and theological semi­
nary." In 1821 the Convention 
opened Columbian College, a na­
tional Baptist school in Washing­
ton Rice became the agent of the 
Convention to raise funds for the 
college as well as for missions.

Columbian College (now George 
Washington University) soon ran 
into financial difficulties which were 
largely blamed on Rice. Although 
the college was finally lost from 
Baptist control in 1903. Baptists 
were awakened during this period 
to the importance of education. The 
beginning of many Baptist colleges 
m the South can be traced to an in­

terest in education stimulated by 
Luther Rice.

Rice felt very keenly the need of 
a journal to inform Baptists about 
missionary progress and to arouse 
informed missionary concern. He 
and others were able to secure the 
appointment in 1816 of a commit­
tee of the Baptist Board of Foreign 
Missions to publish a quarterly mis­
sionary magazine called The Latter 
Day Luminary. Rice managed the 
Luminary during its first years.

A few years after the founding 
of the Convention, Rice also became 
the editor of the first weekly Baptist 
family newspaper in America—The 
Columbian Star. The paper devoted 
much space to reporting missionary 
news.

In response to a need for printed 
materials suitable for distribution by 
home missionaries and other work­
ers. the Baptist General Tract So­
ciety was established in 1824 with 
Rice as its first treasurer.

Luther Rice felt that the Triennial 
Convention should promote Christ­
ian education and religious publica­
tions as well as foreign and domestic 
missions. He believed that Baptists 
should cooperate through the Con­
vention in doing whatever was neces­
sary to bring the kingdom of God on 
earth. Some other Baptist leaders, 
especially those in the North, con­
sidered this multiple involvement un­
wise. They were finally able to secure 
enough backing in 1826 to restrict 
the Triennial Convention to the sup­
port of “foreign and Indian mis­
sions."

Many Baptist leaders from the 
South shared Rice's concept and 
were greatly disappointed in the 
1826 restriction Thus, when the 
Southern Baptist Convention was 
formed in 1845, nine years after 
Rice's death, these men led in or­
ganizing a convention with various 
boards entrusted with different 
phases of denominational work, a 
structure very much like the one Rice 
had wanted for the Triennial Con­
vention. It is rather odd that an “out­
sider"—a New Englander, a former 

Congregationalist, and a “loner” in 
his operations—should have influ­
enced Baptists in the South so mark­
edly.

Woman’s Missionary Union is es­
pecially indebted to Luther Rice. 
During the lifetime of the Triennial 
Convention, it was he more than 
anyone else who inspired the forma­
tion of missionary societies—usually 
called “female mite societies”— 
among Baptist women in the South.

It was Rice who taught and en­
couraged missionary giving by 
southern women. He explained how 
the pooling of many small gifts could 
provide adequate support for both 
foreign and domestic missions. Per­
haps it was from Rice that women 
got the idea of a prayer calendar 
and of a "concert” of prayer. In 
his book Memoir of Rev. Luther 
Rice. James B. Taylor gives an ex­
cerpt from Rice’s journal describing 
his prayer life:

I have adopted it as a rule, to ob­
serve, as generally as circumstances 
will permit, seasons of prayer seven 
times a day. . . . Also observe the first 
and third Mondays in each month as 
days of fasting, humiliation, and 
prayer; the second and fourth, as days 
of thanksgiving and praise. The month­
ly concert of prayer for missions, the 
evening of the first Monday in every 
month; the concert of prayer for Sab­
bath schools, the evening of the second 
Monday in every month; and I have 
concluded to appropriate a season in 
the evening of the third Monday in 
every month, for special prayer for 
the Columbian College, and for a re­
vival of religion in Washington. . . .

With the spread of Convention 
territory across the nation. Southern 
Baptists have made another part of 
Luther Rice’s dream come true. Ap­
parently he never foresaw the frag­
mentation of the Triennial Conven­
tion. As we learn more and more to 
cooperate across Convention lines 
with other Baptist bodies, we are re­
sponding again to the influence of 
Luther Rice, who gave himself with­
out restraint to establishing a single 
Baptist denomination in America.
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MISSIONS in

s past as

them Baptists 
colonialism or 
sociations and 
helpers along-

■ *. ■

HAT about missions in times 
” like fane? b missions work 

the tame at ever, or are radical 
changes needed? Improved transpor­
tation and communication and 
modem conveniences have made the 
life at the missionary much easier. 
What effect do these and other cur­
rent developments have on his work? 
Many people (even in the churches) 
an questioning the validity or the 
continuing relevance of the mission­
ary movement in its traditional 
forms. A peat many other C hristian 
people, without knowing exactly 
why, have a vague feeling that mis­
sions work is a waste of monrx and 
fife.

Regardless of the amount ruth 
or error in these views, thex reflect 
changes in the world and the
church that demand the attm< n d 
foouffrittul Christians who in­
volved in or concerned for 11 .use
of missions.

It is obvious that the s> e of 
Christian missions today is ' ally
new. Instead of a consistent no-
tinrnng pattern, strong anu ’idly
shifting crosscurrents intc ere-



ating conditions of great variety and 
uncertainty.

Everywhere progress in technol­
ogy and the rapid growth of cities 
seem io be outrunning the develop­
ment of the social, moral, and spiri­
tual capacities to deal with the 
problems created. Rapid travel and 
communication in this space age 
have brought people around the 
world close to each other, but prox­
imity has not yielded community and 
nearness does not automatically pro­
duce neighborhood

World cultures arc making con­
tact and intermingling as never be­
fore Often the result is a breaking 
down of traditional elements in the 
local culture and movement toward 
a worldwide urban and secular cul­
ture In other cases, however, the 
meeting of cultures causes revived 
emphasis on the local culture and 
resistance to outside influences 
These local cultural revivals are re­
flected in nationalism and in the con­
flicts between tribes, races, nations, 
and ideologies that create tensions 
and break out in "brush fire" wars 
around the world Behind and be­
neath these crosscurrents there is 
the tremendous Ude of the revolu­
tionary rising expectations of ordi­
nary people everywhere

Such a world by its very nature 
cries out for the good news of a 
loving God and his unchanging pur 
pose of abundant life for all It is 
not easy for the church to know how 
to meet the challenge of such a day

Some of the most serious prob 
lems for Christian missions arc with 
in the church itself Pagan and 
material values and concerns tend 
to consume the energies of the aver 
age church member Missionary con 
viction and compassion are being 
undercut by uncertainty of faith and 
motive Many in the church seem to 
subscribe to the idea that "it doesn't 
matter wh.it you believe, as long as 
you arc sincere" a viewpoint more 
nearly Hindu than Christian

F ven persons with deep interest 
m missions are puzzled and troubled 
because they have inherited a tra­

ditional image of the missionary that 
is out of date: the man in a formal 
black suit and a tropical helmet, 
standing with open Bible before a 
group of primitive tribespeople. 
Many who question the relevance of 
missions are simply expressing the 
irrelevance of their own outdated 
concepts

There is wholesome new emphasis 
today on the oneness of the mission 
of the church, with no real line 
separating Christendom from mis­
sions fields World responsibility is 
not a special elective for an elite 
group All are called, and the mis­
sions field is everywhere Our call­
ing is not merely to verbal witness 
but also to loving ministry Un­
fortunately, it is hard for us to avoid 
a pendulum swing back and forth 
between things that belong together 
in continual creative tension Em­
phasis on the general calling of every 
Christian easily leads to an ignoring 
of the need for more to hear the 
special calling of God to neglected 
places around the world

Amid the difficulties and chal­
lenges of a changing world and the 
new winds blowing in the church, 
the spread of the gospel is hampered 
also by the inadequacies of mission 
ancs and mission leaders Contrary 
to some glorified popular impres­
sions. the workers are quite human, 
subject to weakness, error, and fail­
ure

In spite of these limitations, the 
missions cause can and does move 
forward even in times like these 
Southern Baptists arc engaged in 
new missions advance along numer 
ous lines

Missions work is being projected 
in many places Only a few lands 
in recent years have closed their 
doors to missionaries Other lands 
at the same time have been open 
ing Southern Baptist missionaries 
serving in approximately seventy 
countries find that they are still 
welcome and there is still opportun 
its for effective work often the 
greatest opportunity ever seen in 
those lands

New ways of work are constantly 
being tried or expanded; the mission­
ary associate and missionary journey­
man categories of supplementary 
service are adding strength to our 
missions efforts. Multiplied types of 
specialists are now sent to the fields. 
Vastly increased use is being made 
of mass communications media. Si­
multaneous evangelistic campaigns 
(such as the Crusade of the Ameri­
cas revivals earlier this year) are 
conducted in many fields.

The basic missionary convictions 
of Southern Baptists arc reflected In 
new strength for missions around 
the world—both in the growth of our 
overseas missionary staff to over 2,- 
500 and in the continuing increase, 
of Cooperative Program and Lottie 
Moon Christmas Offering gifts

A new understanding is growing 
among Southern Baptists that the 
pattern of missions work is not one 
of colonialism or paternalism In new 
fields our missionaries initiate the 
work, but as churches and local 
Baptist associations and conventions 
develop, our missionaries work as 
helpers alongside the leaders of those 
local Baptist groups The initiative 
rests with the churches on the field

These developments show that 
new days bring new opportunities 
Armchair philosophers may specu­
late that the day of the missionary 
is over Meanwhile, the missionary 
himself actually experiences the con­
tinuing presence ami power of God 
m his work and secs lives being 
changed and joyous fellowships of 
new Christians facing the challenge 
of witnessing and ministering to the 
world around them Such realities 
give continuing evidence that new 
ways and new opportunities in 
C hristian missions reflect the same 
old truths that God cares for all 
men. that the gospel is "the power 
of God unto salvation'' (Rom 
I 16). and that we are under orders 
from God to do our utmost to share 
his love and his gospel with everyone 
everywhere This is missions, in 
times like these and in whatever 
times that may come
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Although a high percentage of Eu­

ropeans are Christian, personal faith 

and church loyalty seem to be de-

Approdasately 1,1SB,BM Baptists 
can be counted in Europe.

“Missions is more than the sending of foreign mtoslon. 

aries,” states John D. Hughey, Foreign Mission Board 

area secretary for Europe and the Middle East. “Mb- 

sions is also giving fraternal assistance to European Bap­

tist unions.” ROYAL SERVICE takes a look at an out­

standing Baptist leader of the Swedish Baptist Union of 

Finland.

Theo Sommerkamp

Russians, British, Gensnns, Roman- 
tans, and Swedes make up the 
strongest Baptist bodies. Other 
groups are quite small.

Baptist churches can be found in 
every country in Europe except 
Greece, Albania, and a few other 
tiny countries.

Southern Baptist mlnrinnarirr are 
hr Italy, Speh, Portugal. Switzer­
land, Austria, France, West Ger­
many, and Belgium.

Limited financial assistance is given 
to Bap Uris bi Hungary, Romania. 
Finland, Holland, Poland, and 
Yugoslavia.

SUNDELI

A LWAR Samuel Sundell was only 
twenty-three when his father 

died Seven of his eleven brothers 
and sisters were under sixteen years 
of age Rearing the children alone 
was quite a task for his mother Al- 
war’s mother, of course, began to 
receive modest social welfare aid 
after her husband's death She soon 
learned to her added distress that 
she was now deprived of her right to 
vote The law in Finland at that time 
disfranchised anyone who received 
welfare assistance His mother's loss 
of the ballot was one of the social 
injustices that had a deep impact on 
Alwar.

"When you grow up like that, you 
naturally develop an interest in so­
cial affairs." Alwar Sundell com­
ments In his first pastorate, he was 
called on to enlist support for a chil­
dren's home which sharpened his 
awareness of the gospel s social 
meaning. It is not surprising, there­
fore. that Alwar Sundell, who had 
just completed theological studies in 
Sweden wh«n his father died, built 

his career to include both denomina­
tional service and national political 
office

Other influences have also shaped 
Sundcll's life the effects of war in 
Finland during his lifetime and the 
tiny free church minority status of 
Baptists in a country which is domi­
nated by the officially recognized 
Lutheran Church.

Like most of Europe, Finland felt 
the pains of bombings, land battles, 
and other destruction brought on by 
World War II. Finland was caught 
in a squeeze between Germany and 
Russia At war’s end. the Russians 
kept some land formerly belonging 
to Finland in the area where the two 
countries border The Russians also 
required Finland to pay off $300 
million in postwar reparations At 
the same time Finland was paying 
off this indemnity, it also accom­
plished a miracle of sorts in putting 
Us own economy in order This 
deepened Sundell's commitment to 
world peace

Running as a candidate of the 
Swedish Folk Party. Sundell was 
elected to the national parliament in 
•95X This political party, he com­
ments. is unfied by the use of the 
Swedish language which is officially 
recognized although less than 10 
percent of the Finnish population 
use it

Sundell was in parliament for 
'wo terms During this time, he 
advocated such social causes as un­
employment compensation, higher 

retirement pensions, better housing 
for the aged, and low rent housing. 
In foreign policy, Sundcll was then 
and is now a backer of Finnish neu­
trality and a vigorous supporter of 
the United Nations. For a few 
months during his first term in par­
liament Sundell represented Finland 
at the UN General Assembly.

T roubles were to erupt during his 
second term in the national parlia­
ment a few years afterward, troubles 
which would bring an end to his 
national political office.

"There are three hundred mem­
bers of free churches who teach in 
our public schools in Finland," Sun­
dell explains "They are restricted 
from teaching classes in religion in 
the schools Only Lutherans can 
teach religion I introduced a bill to 
give free church members the legal 
right to teach religion " He also cam­
paigned for reforms in the tax laws 
which benefited the established Lu­
theran Church at the expense of the 
free churches The country is over 
90 percent Lutheran

This legislation not only failed but 
Sundell was also fiercely assailed in 
the national press for his role in sup­
port of the free churches In 1966 
he was defeated when he ran for a 
third term in parliament A Luther­
an minister was elected instead

" Baptists have been the most 
radical group in Finland to point out 
the question of religious liberty." 
Sundell states "This has awakened 
the Lutheran Church leaders Our

I I XL \ XI)

Baptist efforts, despite legislative 
failure so far, have not been in vain."

In 1967 another member of par-< 
liament who is not from one of the' 
free churches took up afresh the is­
sue of religious teaching by non­
Lutherans in the public schools. "He 
espouses in principle the same legis­
lation for which I fought several 
years ago,” Sundell notes.

Sundell still pleads the case for 
the Christian to be active in political 
life When he ran for his first public 
office in 1945, that of city council­
man in Vaasa which is a port on the 
Gulf of Bothnia in central Finland, 
his motto was taken from the Sermon 
on the Mount.

"This was my view and my plat­
form. We must have Christian ideals 
in political life in the community," 
he contends "We must apply Chris­
tian love and ideas." He still serves 
on the city council and has been on 
the Vaasa school board since 1952.

In denominational service, Sundell 
was young people's secretary for the 
Swedish Baptist Union in Finland, a 
post he held for twenty years. He 
was also the editor of the union’s 
newspaper for thirty years. The 
Swedish-language union is the larger 
of two Baptist unions in the country. 
The Finnish-language Baptist union 
has about one thousand members. 
The Swedish-language union, con­
centrated along the Gulf of Bothnia, 
directly opposite Sweden, is twice 
the size in membership of the Fin­
nish-language union.
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New Member...

New Ministry

T?EW people have heard of Pleasant Grove Baptist 
* Church, Sharon, Tennessee. It is located in the western 
part of the state in rural Weakley County. Its community 
(Sidonia) claims 100 to 150 population plus an additional 
number of farm families living within a ten-milc radius 
Its economy is primarily based on farming with some of 
the residents traveling into three or four nearby small 
towns to work in businesses or small industries

The Pleasant Grove Baptist Church averages each week 
about one hundred in Sunday School The neighboring 
Holiness Church and Church of Christ also minister to 
the people of the community For a number of years the 
Pleasant Grove church had held traditional Sunday meet­
ings: regular worship, Sunday School, and Training Union 
Then, some few months ago C W Kesner moved from 
Little Rock, Arkansas, to take a position with an aviation 
service at nearby Stewart-Everett Airport His employer 
was a member of Pleasant Grove and naturally he invited 
Mr Kesner to his church Soon Mr Kesner became a 
member. One day he talked to the pastor. Guy Wilkerson, 
who had recently come to the church, about the possibility 
of developing a ministry to the deaf Mr Wilkerson and 
the church were willing but there were no known deaf 
persons in the immediate community This did not deter 
C W Kesner He would find the deaf persons if the 
church would support a ministry to them

A few days later while getting a haircut in nearby I nion 
City. Mr Kesner asked the barber if he knew any deaf 
persons The barber referred him to Richard McGowan, 
a young man who worked in a nearby shoe shop This 
was sufficient for a good beginning. Because deaf persons 
are often gregarious. Kesner felt that this young man would 
know other deaf people Young Richard McGowan and 

Any church of any size 

r in provide a ministry to the deaf 

C W Kesner, new member 

nf P;e,is.i”t Grove Baptist C■ • ch,

Kenneth Day

Mr Kesner began to contact others at once
The following Sunday Mr. Kesner and his wife started 

what has continued to be a most rewarding ministry They 
leave their home about eight on Sunday mornings, criss­
cross several counties within a radius of fifty miles, go to 
Hickman and Fulton in Kentucky, and pick up deaf per­
sons who are eager for the opportunities for fellowship, 
worship, and study at Pleasant Grove Baptist Church

On an average Sunday there will be from seven to 
twelve deaf persons in the services. Mr Kesner teaches 
the Sunday School lesson then interprets with sign language 
the message from the pastor Following the service Mr. 
Kesner transports the deaf persons to their homes, return­
ing to his own home for a late Sunday dinner

Though this is a new ministry to the Pleasant Grove 
Baptist Church, it is not new to C W Kesner For eigh­
teen years he has been a minister to the deaf Because of 
deep interest in deaf persons, he is committed to this 
ministry

At the present time Mr Kesner is working to organize 
a fellowship for the deaf in an area of some 75 to 100 miles 
radius from Sidonia He is also promoting this type work 
in other churches He believes that ‘‘any church of any 
size can provide such a ministry Necessary resources are 
concerned persons ”

The Home Mission Board, under the leadership of the 
Language Missions Department and in cooperation with 
state conventions, offers assistance to every church in the 
development and promotion of a ministry to deaf persons 
Inquiries from any interested persons are welcomed Write 
to your state missions office or to Language Missions De­
partment. Home Mission Board, 1 350 Spring Street, NW.. 
Atlanta. Georgia 30309

the ideas of James Madison, 
delegate to the Constitution 
Convention

That human interaction has become depersonalized in 
this decade is news to no one. The apartment dweller can 
live months without speaking, much less conversing, with 
his nearest neighbor. Routine shopping, errands, and even 
physical checkups can be handled expediently in a me­
chanical, robot way.

Life and daily exchange in the small town has altered, 
also Only the more outgoing persons entertain everyone 
on the block. Strangers remain strange and old friends arc 
seen less and less as the TV set dominates an increasing 
part of the day Many persons in today's social whirl feel 
closer to the TA' regulars than to their neighbors

Living in a community of strangers, self-concepts of 
worth and dignity are replaced by haunting feelings of use­
lessness In contrast, dignity and worth of the individual 
are at the very center of the Christian faith. Man becomes 
the means whereby God fulfils his plans for the world

Study topics this month accent this concept of dignity 
and worth The general WMS meeting will explore God's 
use of men in history Bible study groups will look at 
God's missionary plan or purpose Current missions groups 
will focus attention on God’s use of individuals today 
Round Table groups may wish to read biographies detail­
ing God's use of individuals A guide to such books is 
provided

An additional feature has been added for mission action 
group members and those persons participating in mission 
action projects This month begins a series on barriers 
to concern Prayer groups will find a page of suggestions 
to he used in group meetings

Individuals wishing to read the study-action materials 
may check up on their reading by working the puzzle 
below

STUDY-ACTION PUZZLE

12 3 4 5 6 7

TTlO FT Till 141516171819
Identify each of the following Transfer the appropriate 
letters to fill out the statement above Answers on page 24

1 Pastor who opened a colony to
anyone wishing to live in reli­
gious freedom 1

2 Baptist preacher who influenced

3. Congregational missionary who 
became a Baptist in India in 
1812

4. A man who addressed the 
Athenians on Mars Hill

5. A city that prohibits education 
and outreach by its First Baptist 
Church

6. A nationality that felt that the 
world was divided into parts: 
— and barbarians

7 A man whose mission was to 
free Jewish exiles and rebuild 
the Temple

8 American town from which the 
Judsons sailed for India

9 A mobile office taking the gos­
pel into the streets of Italy

10 A man who opened his home to 
Turkish teen-agers

11 A woman who used Christian 
books to witness at a US mili­
tary installation in Turkey

12 Another name for the General 
Missionary Convention of the 
Baptist Denomination in the 
United States of America for 
Foreign Missions

13 The place where Carey spent 
his life

14 A spiritual revival in America

15 An early missionary to Africa

16 Missionary to English-language 
people in Turkey

17' The man who built BibliTek

18 Ninety percent of the 7 4 mil­
lion population of this country 
is Catholic

19 A famous prayer meeting at- 
attended by The Brethren
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II

GENERAL WMS MEETING

A Spark Catches Fire
Roberta C. Edwards

/’OD used intellectual and theological thought and cn- 
deavor in the latter part of the eighteenth century to 

kindle in young men like Adoniram Judson and Luther 
Rice, a passion for missions which reawakened contem­
porary Christians to their missionary obligation Out of 
the movement Baptists were called of God to their places 
in God's missions plan

In order to understand the spiritual, political, and intel­
lectual currents which produced Judson and Rice, it is 
necessary to review the events which occurred to set the 
scene for the entrances of these men, and to mention some 
of the men God used to bring about these events during 
the period of time which immediately preceded their life­
time. Three factors were influential the struggle for reli­
gious liberty and separation of church and state, the period 
of falling away in which religion became formalized and 
less spiritual, and the Great Awakening in which a spirit 
of evangelism swept America. England, and northern 
Europe.

Struggle for Religious Liberty

Although many of the earliest settlers who migrated 
from England and Europe to America moved from their 
homelands in order to escape persecution from the Church 

of England and lo have freedom to worship according to 
their Separatist views, the colonies did not in fact become 
a land of religious liberty

Among the men used of God to make religious liberty 
a reality in America was Roger Williams, the founder of 
the first Baptist church in America In 1630 Williams 
was invited by the Puritans in Boston to become their 
pastor Feeling that this call was providential. Williams 
went to the colonies Upon arrival, he learned that the 
Puritans believed that the government should support the 
church financially and rule upon those things taught by 
the church Williams decided that the time had come to 
fight state control of the church and suppression of indi­
vidual conscience He refused the offer of the Puritans 
F or his nonconformist views he eventually was tried and 
was ordered to leave the colony During the following 
winter he found refuge among some Indians near Nar- 
ragansett Bay. who. in gratitude for what he did for them, 
gave him a tract of land Here Williams established his 
own colony and opened it to all who wanted to live in 
religious freedom This was the town of Providence and 
later became the state of Rhode Island

At the time of the ratification of the Constitution of the 
new United States. God used another Baptist man to fan 

the spark of religious liberty into fire. John Leland, a 
Baptist minister, rose up to champion religious freedom. 
Leland believed that men should be able to choose for

• themselves the way they wished to worship. In fact, they
• should be given the right not to believe or worship if they 

chose. That the government forced people to support a 
church financially was an infringement on human rights, 
thought Leland. John Leland brought his influence to 
bear on James Madison who was a delegate to the Con­
stitutional Convention. He startled the convention by his 
differentiation between toleration and religious liberty. 
Toleration, in current practice, sanctioned the existence 
of other religious sects, but forced them to endure an in­
ferior status while the established church was not only 
recognized by the government but also supported by the 
government. Religious liberty, on the other hand, per­
mitted persons to worship as their consciences dictated. 
James Madison and Thomas Jefferson (who was influenced 
by another Baptist named Isaac Backus) were responsible 
for introducing the first amendment to the Constitution of 
the United States which reads:

Congress shall make no law respecting an establishment of 
religion, or prohibiting the free exercise thereof; or abridging 
the freedom of speech, or of the press; or of the right of the 
people peaceably to assemble, and to petition the Government 
for redress of grievances
Thus, the full flame of religious liberty was guaranteed 
to burn continually in the United States because these men 
dared to obey God rather than man. (Read Acts 4:13-20.)

The Spirit of Evangelism

Looking back a few years into the 172O’s it is easy to 
see how tinder was produced for the fires of evangelism 
which swept the country in the time which is referred to 
as the Great Awakening About this time many of the 
churches in the colonies and in England had become ex­
tremely rigid The warmth and feeling that was usually 
a part of religious experience had been replaced by formal 
worship services and stilted expressions Church attend­
ance and concern about religious interests had decreased 
It became difficult to reach these self-satisfied people 
The) responded in periods like the great smallpox epi­
demic. the earthquake, or when the Indians grew restless, 
but no great outpouring of the Spirit was evident Many 
unconverted people were members of churches and moral- 
it) was at a low ebb

The Great Awakening was initiated in New Jersey by 
a father and son named William and Gilbert Tennet. 
Presbyterian ministers who preached such fiery heart- 
stirnng sermons that people flocked to hear them There 
was also Jonathan Edwards, a Congregational minister who 
preached with such force and conviction that his hearers 
could not but believe that what he said was the truth His 
principal tenet was that the grace of God was sufficient to 
save men s souls The influence of his revival ministry 
began to spread through the surrounding countryside
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Although these outstanding leaders of the Great Awaken­
ing in America were not Baptists, they contributed much 
to a climate that welcomed the emphasis Baptists placed 
upon individual encounter with Christ in the salvation 
experience.

At the same time God was using another man in Eng­
land and Wales to initiate quickening of religious zeal. 
This man was George Whitefield, a minister who believed 
that it was necessary for man to have a personal experience 
of grace to produce a changed Christian life. During the 
middle of the eighteenth century he made several trips to 
America for evangelistic meetings. People flocked to hear 
him and were stirred by his messages. Many of the con­
verts of these meetings became members of Baptist 
churches or founded their own Baptist congregations. 
(Read Acts 2:1-47.)

The Need for Cooperation

Into this stage of history came two men who provided 
the heartbeat of the modem missionary movement: Adoni­
ram Judson and Luther Rice. During the early nine­
teenth century an incident took place which caused Baptists 
to understand that they needed to develop a type of union 
that would enable them to do some things that they could 
not do alone. This event was the baptism of young Con­
gregational missionaries, Adoniram Judson and his wife 
Ann.

Adoniram Judson had become a missionary to India 
because of two important influences. The first was a pro­
found experience as a seminary student which convinced 
him that God was calling him to carry the Christian reli­
gion to the people of Asia. The second influence was the 
news of an English Baptist, William Carey, who was al­
ready in India and whose expression, “Expect great things 
from God; attempt great things for God," was already 
notable among church people of all denominations. While 
William Carey was working in India with scant financial 
support from British Baptists and few converts to Chris­
tianity, the famous "haystack prayer meeting" took place 
in America. A group of seminary students had met to­
gether in a maple grove one afternoon to talk and pray 
about their burden for foreign missions. When a heavy 
rain came up. they took shelter under a haystack, and 
there they prayed about the need of missionaries to carry 
the gospel to the heathen in Asia. They eventually or­
ganized a group of students called The Brethren who 
mutually agreed to follow any leadership toward mission­
ary service Judson joined The Brethren and with three 
others offered himself for missionary service At this time, 
no church in the United States had ever sponsored or sup­
ported a missionary on a foreign field. After much dis­
couragement. Judson was appointed by the Massachusetts 
Congregational churches through an agency called the 
American Board of Commissioners for Foreign Missions, 
along with three other men at a salary of $666.66 per year. 
About this time a fifth man. Luther Rice, applied for
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appointment and was accepted on the condition that he 
provide his own travel funds. Six days before they were 
scheduled to sail, Luther Rice undertook a journey by 
horseback to various churches, raising enough money for 
his one-way passage to India. In 1812 Adoniram Judson, 
his wife, and another couple sailed from Salem for India; 
Luther Rice and two other missionaries sailed from Phil­
adelphia.

k During the long and arduous voyage Judson occupied 
"his time with the study of the Greek New Testament. His 

study of the Gospels persuaded him that church member­
ship should be restricted to persons having a personal 
experience of grace through Christ, ye observed that this 
experience was followed by baptism in the New Testament. 
Finding no reference to the baptizing of infants as practiced 
in the Congregational Church, he concluded that the 
Baptist doctrines were more nearly true. This posed a 
tremendous problem. Turning away from Congregational 
sponsorship meant being stranded in a foreign land with no 
support.

In the meantime, Luther Rice, sailing on another ship, 
had also been studying the New Testament. He too reached 
the conclusion that he should adopt the Baptist position 
in regard to believer's baptism Who. except these men 
who had grown up in religious freedom, would have had 
the courage to follow the leadership of the Spirit and the 
dictates of their minds9

The Judsons and Rice were soon faced with the con­
sequences of their actions. They informed the Congrega- 
tionalist board that they had become Baptists. The Baptists 
of America had no foreign missions agency and no money 
The war with Great Britain had begun, and communica­
tions were almost impossible. About a year after they had 
left their homeland, the Judsons and Rice decided that 
there was only one practical course of action Rice had 
become ill. and it was decided that he should return to 
America to solicit funds while regaining health He would 
then return to India’to join his friends The Judsons de­
cided to go on to Burma, where they established head­
quarters in Rangoon along with Felix Carey, the son of 
William Carey

The Molding of a Convention

Back in America. Luther Rice was a romantic figure 
His natural confidence and friendship made this tall, dark­
haired bachelor a welcome guest in many homes as he set 
out to win the support of Baptists for the Judson mission 
He campaigned first in Massachusetts and then went on 
south to the middle Atlantic and southern states, traveling 
on horseback, by stagecoach, and even on foot in all kinds
of weather He visited homes and churches, always telling 
the story of the missionaries whom he had left behind in 
India As he traveled Rice had plenty of time to think 
He reasoned that it was impossible for a single congrega­
tion or association to support missions work on any foreign 

field. If Baptists would unite in some way, they could 
support not only the Judsons, but also many other mis­
sionaries in many areas of the world. The spark began to 
catch fire, fanned by Rice’s own enthusiasm and dedica­
tion to the plan of God for missions.

One day while riding the stagecoach from Petersburg 
to Richmond, Virginia, Rice was lost in thought. All of 
a sudden an idea dawned upon him: Why could not Bap­
tists form an organization just as Congregational churches 
had. From that day on. Rice talked of this idea with every 
Baptist he met. Each evening was spent writing letters to 
enlist the help of men who could formulate the organiza­
tion.

May 18, 1814, was set as the date for a meeting to 
consider such an organization. Since the Philadelphia 
Baptist Association was not only the oldest association, but 
also the one most centrally located, it seemed the logical 
one to call the meeting. Every society, association, or 
church that would pledge $100 a year to the missionary 
task through the convention was invited to send two dele­
gates Thirty-three persons attended the meeting represent­
ing eleven states and the District of Columbia. Calling 
themselves the General Missionary Convention of the Bap­
tist Denomination in the United States of America for 
Foreign Missions, they determined to meet every three 
years. The convention later came to be called the Trien­
nial Convention. From this organization came the forma­
tion of Rice's dream, the Baptist Board of Foreign Missions 
for the United States. This board representing all the 
Baptists of America assumed responsibility for the Judsons 
and future missionaries

When this board met for the first time in 1914, the first 
motion commended Luther Rice for his success in urging 
Baptists to form such a body The second motion com­
missioned Rice with the responsibility of executing the 
plans of the board

The spark had caught fire and the flame burned brightly 
as the third resolution was presented and passed. Adoniram 
Judson became the first Baptist missionary from America

God used Luther Rice to bring Baptist churches into an 
organized denomination that would provide for missions 
growth It was with the appointment of one missionary 
that Baptists became a part of the modern missionary 
movement and found a place in God's plan for missions 
(Read Matt 28 18-20 )

Today the spark which caught fire tn a land made free 
for personal religious convictions, swept by the winds of 
the spirit of revivalism through the Great Awakening, 
burns as a flame which is seen around the world The cur­
rent missions work of both the Southern and American 
Baptist conventions was begun by this spark Today, ap­
proximate!) 2,500 foreign missionaries in approximately 
seventy countries are supported by our denomination 
through the implementation of the Foreign Mission Board 
of the Southern Baptist Convention

GUIDE---------------
for Central WMS Meeting

What do you want to accomplish?

During October and November 
participants in general WMS meet­
ings will explore the way God has 
used events in history to establish 
and enlarge the missionary move­
ment By reflecting on God's use of 
men at historical turning points, 
members should be led to recognize 
God's direction of Christians today

WMS members should be led to 
see God's use of events in history to 
expand man's involvement in the 
missionary plan. Certain historical 
situations had to occur before Bap­
tists could be called of God to their 
place in God's missions plan Reli­
gious freedom had to exist in Amer­
ica before a Congregationalist could 
choose of his own free will to be­
come a Baptist A spiritual awaken­
ing had to exist before American 
men could become sensitive to for­
eign needs Baptists had to have a 
reason to organize before a conven-

desire to do something.
2. Establish the idea that histor­

ical events build upon each other in 
building block fashion. Take one of 
the choices outlined and show the 
influence of past circumstances on 
this choice.

3. Ask one woman to tell the 
story of Judson and Rice using the 
color pictures from Heroes of Bap­
tist Missions (see below) Organize 
the study material given under the 
topics, "The Need for Coopera­
tion, '' page 17. and "The Molding 
of a Convention,” page 18, around 
(he seven pictures of Judson and 
Rice Additional material can be 
found in • Luther Rice Believer in 
Tomorrow. Evelyn Thompson. 
$3.95; To the Golden Shore, Court­
ney Anderson, and *The Indomit­
able Baptists, O K and Marjorie 
Armstrong, $5 95 The books listed 
above with an asterisk are available 
from Baptist Book Store

4 Show the conditions that had

baptism need for Baptist 
support

Carey The Brethren

Judson and Rice to

spiritual awakening

spiritual stagnation

religious freedom

Baptist acceptance of 
responsibilities

Triennial Convention

6 Refer members to the October 
issue of The Commission. This year 
celebrates the 125th Anniversary of 
the Home Mission Board and the 
Foreign Mission Board. Summarize 
the events producing the Southern 
Baptist Convention.

What planning must you do before 

the meeting?

1 Plan the introductory material 
relating to personal choices.

2 Arrange for one person to tell
tion could emerge

How can you accomplish this aim?

I Explore the question What 
must exist before a person can make 
a choice9 Outline three choices com­
mon to the experience of your group 
Show that in each case certain con­
dition*- had to exist ( I ) the right to 
make a choice. (2) two or more 
alternatives to choose from. (3 I the

MEETING PLAN

Ca to P'ayer
B js ness
p”.">ot>onai Feature see WMS Fore 

aste' p 35)
S’jd» Session see pp 16 18

to exist before Baptist missionary 
work could begin

a Ask one woman to summarize 
the study material under the topic. 
"Struggle for Religious Liberty." 
page 16. emphasizing the fact that 
this freedom had to exist before 
Judson and Rice could choose to 
become Baptists rather than Congre- 
gationalists

b Ask one woman to summarize 
the study material under the topic. 
"The Spirit of Evangelism," page 
17. emphasizing the fact that the 
warmth of spiritual awakening had 
to touch cold churches before young 
men such as Ju Ison and Rice could 
he sent

5 Summarize the study session 
showing the way Baptist cooperative 
support of foreign missions was built 
on a foundation of other circum­
stances Make a simple chart

the story of Judson and Rice. Work 
with this person to organize the story 
and (he pictures

3 Order Heroes of Baptist Mis­
sions. $100, from Woman's Mis­
sionary Union. 6(H) North Twentieth 
Street. Birmingham. Alabama 35203.

4 Arrange for two people to 
summarize the two topics, "Struggle 
for Religious Liberty" and "The 
Spirit of Evangelism.” Be certain 
that they understand the relationship 
of their topics to the study aim

5 Prepare the chart shown 
above Use chalkboard or poster 
paper

6 Secure an October copy of the 
The Commission. This would be an 
excellent time to promote subscrip­
tions to The Commission. $1.50 per 
year, from Foreign Mission Board, 
P O Box 6597, Richmond. Virginia 
23230
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CURRENT MISSIONS 
GROUPS

Ujiacclaimed Disciples
Elizabeth Johnson Morgan

TAOES God sec each person as an individual with a dis­
junct personality and set of abilities? Can his redeeming 
purpose for the world possibly be implemented through 
individuals? What part do you as an individual have in this 
divine purpose?

God Uses Individuals

God did not create man to be manipulated as an inani­
mate object. He created man as an individual. Each man 
has a distinct purpose operating under a personal will. 
That the planet on which we dwell is becoming more 
crowded does not mean that God has abandoned his plan 
for individual persons. God still uses individuals, as he has 
done in the past.

Both the Old and New Testaments offer many examples: 
an adopted slave child. Moses; a shepherd boy. David, a 
harlot, Rahab, a herdsman. Amos A not-so-familiar name 
is that of Cyrus in Isaiah 45:1-6. The passage stresses 
God's calling him by name God had a clear-cut reason for 
this personal recognition Cyrus' immediate mission was to 
free Jewish exiles and rebuild the Temple, but God's ulti­
mate purpose was that men "may know from the rising of 
the sun. and from the west, that there is none beside me 
I am the Lord, and there is none else" (Isa 45:6) In order 
for Cyrus to fulfil this plan. God promised divine help "I 
will go before you and level the mountains" (Isa 45 2 
RSV)

This divine pattern between individuals and God con­
tinues in New Testament times a tax collector. Matthew, 
a fisherman. Peter, a business woman. Lydia, and two 
hostesses. Mary and Martha. Jesus was ever conscious of 
individuals When throngs of people crowded about Jesus, 
he knew that the hem of his garment had been touched. 
When faced with the task of feeding the multitude, he chose 
the lunch of one little boy.

In post-biblical history we recall the names of Joan of 
Arc. Martin Luther. David Livingstone, and Lottie Moon 
But there were others with unknown names. A person does 
not have to be a ruler, a preacher, or a missionary to fulfil 
a distinct role of Christian usefulness Would we know 

about Mary and Martha today if they had not offered 
frequent hospitality to our Lord?

Through Hospitality

God still uses Christian hospitality. Unfortunately, for 
some, it is becoming a neglected art. Perhaps there are 
many reasons for the present decline of hospitality—lack 
of household help, rising food prices, crowded family 
schedules, and increased numbers of working women. On 
the other hand, American women have better homes with 
more appliances than any housewives in the world Gen­
uine hospitality does not depend on affluence It is sharing 
oneself and one's noblest personal possession, the home

The role of New Testament women was one of hospital­
ity. In 1 Timothy 5: 10 a widow was to be commended if 
she had “been hospitable to strangers" (Phillips). In 
Romans 12 13 Paul said, "Make a practice of hospitality" 
(Moffatt) Hebrews 13 2 said. "Do not remain neglectful 
of hospitality to strangers" (Williams) Jesus himself said 
that a part of eternal reward would be based on hospitality 
"I was hungry and you fed me. thirsty and you gave me 
drink. I was a stranger and you received me in your 
homes" ( Matt 25 35 TEV )

During the first century, the New Testament church met 
in homes On many occasions since that time. Christians 
have depended on hospitality for places of worship and 
Bible study Baptist work in Austria had such a beginning 
In 1869. after Protestants had been persecuted by Catholics 
for centuries, a German Baptist pioneer. Johann Oncken, 
passing through Vienna, baptized five converts Five other 
converts had been baptized previously as a result of their 
attending a family Bible study group The ten converts 
united, forming a Baptist church on December 20. 1869 
Numbering only 750 members in eight churches. Austrian 
Baptists are still in the minority Ninety percent of the ? 4 
million population in Austria is Catholic The Conference 
of the European Baptist Federation met in \ lenna for the 
first time in August From the hospitality of one home has 
come the hospitality of one country to a continent

Home Bible study groups are stijl opening doors for 

missions. In Minnesota a young couple from a trailer court 
joined a small Baptist church. When welcoming them, the 
pastor casually mentioned that he had long wanted a spe­
cific ministry to families in the trailer village. The couple 
immediately offered their mobile home for a Bible study 

group. Another witness began when hospitality bridged the 
gap between the community and the church.

Bob and Dee Mason serving with a military installation 
in Ankara, Turkey, found time to sponsor a club for teen­
agers in their home. Finding that teen-agers living in 
Ankara have few opportunities for social activities, the 
Masons began a Challenge Club to answer this need and 
offer a spiritual charge to each young person to serve 
Christ. Interested teen-agers were welcomed to the Mason 
home between four and eight o’clock each Saturday. 
Christian films were shown, discussions were held, and the 
Bible was studied. Refreshments and the hilarity of youth 
accented the meetings.

Mrs Fox lived alone in a comfortable city neighbor­
hood For many weeks she had taken children from three 
Latin American families to her church for weekday recrea­
tion and Bible study. Realizing that the parents of these 
children had no Christian influence, she planned a Christ­
mas party in her home for both parents and children. In 
order to bridge the cultural gap. she asked the mothers to 
help prepare some of their favorite dishes. Fifteen persons 
attended the festivity, along with a Latin American pastor 
who read the Christmas story in Spanish and invited the 
families to Bible study.

Thus. Christian hospitality provided the atmosphere for 
a beginning witness. The parents of these children are now 
hearing the Bible regularly. The art of sharing a home may 
be one of the most significant forms of witness amid in­
creasing depersonalization

Through Personal Skills

God uses individuals in ways other than the extension of 
hospitality Mrs Ben Lawton, missionary to Italy, tells 
how Signor Roffino used his ingenuity to remodel the in­
side of the Ford truck they used for mobile missions Signor 
Roffino formerly had a metal shop in his basement, but 
when the salary scale went up he could not afford to keep 
his workers He closed his shop and went to work in the 
Fiat factory

But Signor Roffino could still work at night For six 
months, from nine to eleven o'clock, he worked in his base­
ment on the missions truck, now called BibliTek The 
metal strips became the skeleton for a mobile office which 
lakes the gospel out into the streets of Italy Sliding shelves, 
panels, and drawers carry a record player, electric organ, 
tape- recorder, books, files, mimeograph machine, ampli­
fiers. and platforms to be used in (he street

God used another individual with an ordinary skill to 
somplete an extraordinary task One woman toured Fitz­
simmons US Army Hospital in Denver. Colorado, with a 
group of people Stopping to chat with some of the patients. 

she learned of their need for friendship and attention. She 
returned many times with cookies and encouraging words. 
Enlisting more women to help her, she was responsible for 
the beginning of a new ministry of witnessing.

A young petroleum engineer who went to Turkey in 
1961 is another example of a person using his unique situa­
tion for the cause of Christ. Even before he went he wrote 
the Foreign Mission Board telling them of his interest in 
seeing Baptist work started there. He was instrumental in 
the beginning of a Training Union group which later be­
came a Baptist fellowship group. This group met once a 
month with various missionaries from Lebanon leading in 
worship. Mrs. James Leeper, missionary to the English- 
language people of Turkey, writes: “Tom opened the door 
for our work here in Turkey and then led us in by being 
our most gracious host, in that he turned his house over to 
us for the first two months after our arrival. It helped our 
adjustment to life in Turkey immensely.”

Through Everyday Reactions

From day to day God uses individuals in the mere rou­
tine of living. A Christian working at his daily job cither 
reflects or negates a Christian witness.

Another couple in Turkey were fine examples of Chris­
tians who used their vocational situation as a basis for day- 
to-day Christian witness. Colonel and Mrs. George Mead­
ers were able to give a unique witness to persons of all 
military ranks. Mrs. Meaders was instrumental in begin­
ning several women's Bible study groups. She felt that 
Christian books could be used to reach people for Christ 
and help Christians grow spiritually. She ordered books 
continually, keeping a supply on hand to answer particular 
questions or meet specific needs. On special occasions, 
such as birthdays, weddings, a baby's birth, she gave a 
pertinent book The Meaders' home was always open to 
Christians and to those seeking spiritual meaning for their 
lives. Colonel Meaders, a deacon in the church, was instru­
mental in obtaining the auditorium now used by the Eng­
lish-language congregation for worship

After realizing that he needed a more personal concern 
for humanity, Jerry Westfall, an American young man, 
started a “loving-people crusade " Without telling anybody 
of his plan, he began looking for ways to love people The 
first day of his crusade he noticed his landlord emptying 
the trash barrels On an impulse he offered to help The 
astonished landlord warmed to him and a new relationship 
blossomed Before long. Jerry realized that he was not the 
same person Searching for ways to offer a kind word, do 
an odd job. listen to a pressing problem had brought pur­
pose to life

Every day can be an adventure for God1 An individual 
who searches for ways of helping others may find that she 
is doing some unusual things She may be going out of her 
way to help somebody, to speak a sympathetic word to a 
tired grocery checker, a harried waitress, a nerve-spent 
mother, or a bored bus driver She must ask herself Is it

21
ROYAL SERVICE • OCTOBER 196920



more important that I find just that certain dress, or that I 
show Christian concern toward a provocative, offensive 
saleslady who may have problems I do not know about? Is 
it more important to get to a meeting on time or to help a 
blind broom salesman at my door who is trying to make an 
honest living?

Procrastination will deaden a holy impulse to reach out 
to others. A new family in the block or next apartment 
needs help now rather than next week. A mother whose 
last child has gone to college needs a concerned response 
now rather than six weeks from now when the pain is 
deadened. And there are others—the lonely family who 
has just buried a loved ort^Tthe young newlyweds who,

after a month of “her” cooking, would love to share yo* 
table; the college student who is fed up with dormitory 
routine; the busy person on your church staff to whoa 
mending is a chore—who need the ordinary response of 
a committed Christian.

God does use individuals in many ways, both eonsciom 
ly and unconsciously. Any woman who has not experienced 
the meaning and satisfaction of useful living can do so on 
two conditions: (1) she must want to do for others more 
than for herself; (2) she must rely on the power of God. 
The promise is yet true, as it was for Cyrus—“I will go 
before you and level the mountains” (Isa. 45:2 RSV).

BIBLE STUDY GROUPS

Bible Passages for Study: Isaiah 49:1-6, 
Acts 17:22-31, Ephesians 3:1-21.

God’s Plan of the Ages

GUIDE
Howard P. Colson

for Current Missions Groups

What do you want to accomplish?
During October, November, and 

December current missions studies 
center upon God's use of individuals 
to make known his work among peo­
ple. Members should be led to see 
ways God uses church members and 
missionaries to fulfil his purposes 
They should develop a deeper sense 
of God's use of varied abilities, the 
knowledge that missionaries do many 
of the same things that other church 
members do. and a concept of the 
church's role in training disciples

The October study emphasizes 
God's use of individuals to do his 
work. Members should be led to see 
that every person has a personal re­
sponsibility to fulfil God's purposes

MEETING PLAN
Announcement of WMS projects and 

plans
Preview of general WMS study topic for 

next month (see WMS Forecaster, 
p 35)

Information and discussion of mission 
action projects

Prayer for mission action projects
Group planning for next month
Study Session (see pp 20-22)
Call to Prayer 

and that the strength and ability to 
fulfil this obligation comes from 
God

How can you accomplish this aim?
1 Ask women to name ways they 

think God is using individuals today 
(List on a chalkboard )

a. Discuss the self-initiated min­
istry of C W Kesner, “A New 
Member A New Ministry," page 
14

b. Discuss the efforts in Alwar 
Sundell's fight for religious freedom, 
"Sundell of Finland," page 12.

c. Consider Luther Rice, page 
8. Trace the ways he was used by 
God in the nineteenth century Since 
Southern Baptist organization is 
much more highly developed in the 
twentieth century, what opportuni­
ties exist for significant denomina­
tional service

2. Read aloud these references 
Isaiah 45:1-6; 1 Timothy 5 10. 
Romans 12 13. Hebrews 13 2. 
Matthew 25 35 List the ways God 
used men and women in the Bible 
Compare this list with the list of 
ways God uses individuals today In 
what ways are they similar or dif­
ferent?

3 Discuss conditions or attitudes 
that make it difficult for laypeople 
to find creative ways of serving God 
today.

4 Ask one or more women to

summarize the study material. Divide 
the group into two listening teams. 
Ask one team to listen for specific 
ways God is using individuals in 
Italy, Turkey, Austria, and middle 
USA. Ask the other team to listen 
for information telling what kind of 
people God is using (persons with 
special skills, educated persons, per­
sons with special talents). After the 
group has heard the study material, 
ask each listening team to report

5. Ask women to suggest specific 
ways they can participate in Chris­
tian service. Challenge each woman 
to think creatively of some new ser­
vice activity she might do before the 
next meeting. Women may wish to 
record the results of these individual 
projects for report at the next meet­
ing

What planning must you do before 
the meeting?

1 Read the study material, the 
Bible references, and the supporting 
articles to be used in discussion

2 Ask one or more persons to 
prepare summaries of study mate­
rials

3 Make provision for a chalk­
board or suitable paper to record 
lists

4 Think through discussion plans 
Be sure that you have some ways 
individuals may participate in Chris­
tian service in mind to stimulate the 
group

Studies beginning this month will be concerned with 
what the Bible has to say about God's missionary purpose 
and plan. The fact that God has always had such a plan 
becomes evident in Paul's letter to the Ephesians. He 
speaks of "the eternal purpose" which God “has realized 
in Christ Jesus our Lord" (Eph 3 11 RSV) The phrase 
"the eternal purpose" has been translated "the plan of the 
ages."

From those meaningful words came the title of a re­
markable book. Missions in the Plan of the Ages by William 
Owen Carver It was the textbook which Dr Carver used 
at Southern Seminary to help his students understand and 
appreciate the place of missions in God's eternal purpose 
for the world Passage after passage was marshalled to 
show that missions was no afterthought, but that from all 
eternity God had purposed salvation through Christ for 
people of all nations and races, and that missions is his 
plan of getting the message to them

1 The Mission of the Messiah. Isaiah 49.1-6.
Much of the material in chapters 49-58 of Isaiah is mes­

sianic It foretells the coming and work of God s servant- 
king, the Redeemer Chapter 49 predicts that this coming 
servant-king will restore captive Israel and bring light to 
the Gentiles

In the verses we are particularly considering, the speaker 
is the servant himself, the Messiah He addresses his words 
to the nations, for his message concerns all mankind He 
speaks as a missionary to distant coasts and to peoples 
afar, he summons the whole world to hear about his mis­
sion (49 la). He states that he was chosen by God for his 
task (49 lb) Although his weapons arc not military, his 
mouth will be like a sharp sword, his words will be piercing, 
(hey will be effective (49 2a) Until the proper time he will 
be hidden like an arrow in a quiver (49 2b) Verse 4 speaks 
of his initial discouragement, but verse 6 states that God 
has enlarged his mission to include not only the tribes of 
Jacob, but also all the nations of the world

Verse 3 seems to say that the servant is Israel, either the 
nation as a whole or the more spiritual portion of it. But4 
from the Christian point of view, only Christ could com-a 
pletely fulfil the requirements of what is predicted here. 
More than the nation is involved. If a world was to be re­
deemed, Christ had to come. It is true that Israel herself 
was to be a light to the nations, but as Leo Green says in 
God Reigns. "Israel can never fill this role apart from an 
ideal Israelite who will make it possible."

When we look at verse 6 from the point of view that God 
is speaking to the Messiah, the words take on a wonderful 
missionary meaning

It is too light a thing that you should be my servant
io raise up the tribes of Jacob
and to restore the preserved of Israel,

I will give you as a light to the nations.
that my salvation may reach lo the end of
the earth (Isaiah 49:6 RSV)

Consider the phrase "light to the nations." (The KJV 
says "lights to the Gentiles ') We are reminded that the 
Bible clearly indicates that Israel, beginning with Abraham, 
was marked as a missionary nation Through her, God 
would bring to the entire world the blessings of the know­
ledge of himself He promised Abraham, "In thee shall 
all the families of the earth be blessed " (Gen. 12 3). (See 
also Gen 18 18. 22.18. 28 14 ) But the New Testament 
gives us important additional light The way by which God 
meant to fulfil his purpose of world redemption was 
through his Messiah, the Christ (Sec Acts 3 25-26; Rom. 
4 13, Gal 3 8,16 )

Look also at the closing clause of Isaiah 49 6—", that 
my salvation may reach to the end of the earth." The re­
demption which God purposed in and through his Son was 
never intended to be limited to one sector of the human 
race It is for all nations and peoples and tongues, even to 
earth's remotest bounds.

In his btxik God Reigns. Leo Green cites a story from 
Ruth Seabury's Ixxik So Send I You about Portuguese West
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Africa. At the climax of the story, one of the nationals says 
to a missionary, “You have opened for us, a big, wide door 
to the world. . . . Now we know that when you join the 
Church of Christ, you join a world thing."

2. One God, One World. Acts 17:22-31.
When Paul addressed the Athenians on Mars Hill, he 

faced a sophisticated audience. He could not approach 
them in the way he would have preached to a Jewish audi­
ence with a spiritual grounding in Old Testament truth. 
Instead, he made it a point to relate his message to the 
religious background and prajpces of the Hellenistic world. 
In that background there was a multiplicity of gods and 
goddesses. Athens was teeming with images, altars, and 
shrines.

As soon as the apostle had finished referring to Athenian 
worship, including the altar “to the unknown god,” he 
began to talk about “the God who made the world” (17:24 
RSV). In doing so, of course, he was implying something 
which all Jews and all Christians firmly believe: there is 
but one God in all the universe. That conviction is based 
on divine revelation.

With one God as Creator, said Paul, there is just one 
world. But the Greeks, like the Jews, thought of mankind 
as being divided into two main parts. To the Jews the 
world consisted of Jews and Gentiles, and Gentiles were 
hardly much better than dogs. In fact, “dogs” is what the 
Jews called Gentiles. To the Greeks the world consisted of 
Greeks (the cultured people) and Barbarians (the uncouth 
hordes). But Paul said that God had “made from one every 
nation of men to live on all the face of the earth" (17:26
RSV). So humanity is one, regardless of nationality, cul­
ture, or color.

Furthermore, since there is only one God and he made 
all men, it follows that there is only one God for mankind 
to worship. That God is the God Paul preached, the God 
who sent into the world “a man” (Jesus) to be the righteous 
judge of all the world (17:31). In view of coming judgment, 
said Paul, God is now commanding all men everywhere to 
repent (17:30).

The speaker was interrupted before he could finish his 
address. His reference to Christ’s resurrection (17:31) was 
more than his hearers were prepared to accept. But had he 
gone on, he probably would have made an additional point. 
He would have said that since there is but one God and one 
human race, the “man” whom God sent into the world is 
its one and only Saviour. Does not this fact logically follow 
from what the apostle had already said?

The missionary implications of the sermon on Mars Hill 
are tremendous. They reach out to include the entire world. 
One God, one world, one Saviour—those three basic truths 
lead to the inescapable conclusion that God has always had 
a missionary purpose and a missionary plan for his world.

There are those today who tell us that all people have 
their religions. Christianity, they say, is the white man’s 
religion. Hinduism and Buddhism are for the brown skinned 
people; Confucianism and Shintoism for the yellow skinned,

God Uses Men and Events

1. Roger Williams 11. Mrs. Meaders
2. John Leland 12. Triennial
3. Adoniram Judson 13. India
4. Paul 14. Great Awakening
5. Moscow 15. Devid Livingstone
6. Greeks 16. James Leeper
7. Cyrus 17. RoHino
8. Salem 18. Austria
9. BlbliTek 19. Haystack

10. Bob Mason

animism for the black skinned, and
Furthermore, they say, those religions are good for the 
peoples- who follow them. But such ideas are certainly not 
Christian; they are not in accord with God's plan. To us 
the fact that there is only one God, one world, and one 
Saviour is basic, and that truth requires us to be missionary. 
There is no escaping it.

3. The Church in God’s Plan. Ephesians 3:1-13.
The letter to the Ephesians is one of the most mission­

centered books in the Bible. It is also a great book in terms 
of its revelation of the nature and mission of the church.

Islam for the Arabs.

These two themes, missions and the church, come to a focus 
in chapter 3.

Note that in verse 1 Paul refers to himself as “the pris­
oner of Jesus Christ for you Gentiles.” That statement not 
only tells us that he was in prison when he wrote this epistle, 
but also it tells us more. He was a prisoner not merely as 
one who was suffering in the service of Christ; he was a 
prisoner on behalf of the Gentiles. For that reason the Jews 
detested and persecuted him. His present imprisonment 
was due to that hatred and persecution. But his imprison­
ment was only an incident in his remarkable, God-given 
mission. For although he was a Jew, he had been chosen by 
God to proclaim the gospel to the Gentiles throughout the 
entire Graeco-Roman world. His readers were well aware 
of that fact.

In verse 3 the apostle speaks of a mystery of Christ the 
meaning of which was formerly hidden but now has been 
revealed to Christian apostles and prophets (3:5). Paul will 
now proceed to explain that mystery. It. is the fact that the 
Gentiles are “fellow heirs” with Jewish believers and 
“members of the same body” (the church) “and partakers 
of the promise in Christ Jesus through the gospel” (3:6 
RSV). In other words, God’s new people (the New Testa­
ment church) are no narrow, nationalistic group. The 
church is a world thing. It is for all who believe. In verse 
10 Paul says that the church, made up of believers from 

every sector of humanity, is intended to make known, even 
to the heavenly principalities and powers, “the manifold 

wisdom of God.”
This divine wisdom of which Paul speaks is the marvel­

ous fact that the church of the Lord Jesus Christ is God’s 
chosen instrument for world redemption. In God’s purpose 
the church is the successor to the Israel of the Old Testa­
ment. Abraham and the Jewish nation were divinely chosen 
to bring God’s blessings to the world. But narrow national­
ism hindered Israel’s fulfilment of God’s plan. Moreover, 
it took Christ and his church to realize God’s full purpose 
of making his salvation available to all the world. The 
church is a missionary body. It comes into existence through 
missions and it exists for the purpose of extending missions.

All of this is a part of God’s eternal plan. As we have 
already pointed out, it was “according to the eternal pur­
pose which he purposed in Christ Jesus our Lord” (3:11). 
God’s redemption was never intended for just one portion 
of mankind, certainly not for just one race. It was intended 
for all. God’s purpose for and through his church is a 
worldwide missionary purpose. When the church attains its 
final glory it will fully manifest the wisdom of God in so 
planning it.

4. One Family in God. Ephesians 3:14-21.
This passage is one of Paul’s sublime prayers. The great 

apostle prays that his readers may be filled with spiritual
power and discernment. In Ephesians: Pattern for Chris­
tian Living. Ray Summers entitles the paragraph, “Re­
demption's Ultimate Goal.” For our purpose now. verses 
15 and 18 are most significant for they shed beautiful 
light on God’s missionary plan.

Paul says, “I fall on my knees before the Father, from 
whom every family in heaven and on earth receives its true 
name” (3:14-15 TEV). The words speak of God’s univer­
sal fatherhood; however, they do not mean that every fam­
ily worships God or will ultimately be saved. Charles R 
Erdman in his book The Epistle of Paul to the Ephesians 
says the words do teach “that every group or community 
of intelligent beings, whether of men or of angels, gets the 
significant name of ‘family’ from the one ‘Father.’ Each 
group or order is related to God as the common Father of

We must not confuse this idea of fatherhood with that 
special filial relationship which the redeemed enjoy with 
God through faith in Jesus Christ. What is here described 
is the general relation to God which all people have by 
virtue of his being the Creator of all Paul’s words, how­
ever. certainly imply that God’s offer of salvation is un­
limited All groups and communities of the world’s vast 
population are the objects of God's missionary concern. 
He wants to have one great family in which all peoples 
have a part.

In verse 18 Paul prays that his readers may have power 
to comprehend the scope of God’s marvelous redeeming 
love He prays that with all the saints we may be able to 
understand that love. “With all the saints” is a most signifi­

cant phrase. It might well be translated, “together with all 
of Christ’s people.” (See Eph. 4:13 RSV—“until we all 
attain ....”)

The particular point for us to note here is that God has 
in mind one great family in him, a family which will include 
believers from every segment of humanity—Indians, Ne­
groes, Chinese, Russians, Cubans, Brazilians, Puerto 
Ricans, Israelis, Arabs, Indonesians, Polynesians, and all 
other peoples. For it is not only possible for all to come to 
Christ and become “saints” but God wants them all in his 
one great family, of which he is Father. And we who call 
ourselves God’s children, members of his family, have 
missed his whole intention if we act as if the gospel of 
redeeming love is just for people of our own race, nation, 
and kind.

God has a plan of the ages which includes all people 
everywhere. Let us join forces with him in the realization 
of his plan. That is what missions means.

____ GUIDE—----------------
for Bible Study Groupt

Hoyt R. Wilson

Bible material on pages 23-25 may 
be studied in one to four sessions.

Study Question: What evidence is there
(hat God had a missionary purpose 
through all the ages?

To Begin:
Write on the chalkboard (as the 

group watches) this question: How 
did she do it? On the successful 
completion of a difficult task someone 
is usually heard to say. “How did she 
do it?” How did she bake such a 
delicious cake or make that beautiful

MEETING PLAN

Call to Prayer
Group planning led by leader
Preview of general WMS meeting study 

topic for next month (see WMS Fore­
caster, p 35)

Announcement of WMS projects and 
plans

Study session
Information and discussion of mission 

action projects
Prayer for mission action and other 

causes in community
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dress. Usually the person had a plan 
that made her work successful. The 
Bible tells us of God’s missionary pur­
pose and plan: a plan through the ages. 
Our study today deals with this plan.

1. The Mission of the Messiah.
Isaiah 49:1-6.

Ask the group members to read the 
heading over the top of the column of 
Isaiah 49 from their BiblesZThis tells 
the theme of the chapter. Most edi­
tions will state that the chapter deals 
with God announcing his mission.

As the passage is studied ask this 
question: In what two ways did the 
speaker's words have missionary mean­
ing? (They were addressed to people 
far away and he states that he was 
chosen by God for his task.)

Make use of Dr. Colson’s treatment 
of verse 3 by asking this question: Who 
is spoken of as the servant—Israel, a 
remnant of Israel, or Christ? Which do 
you think and why?

Dr. Colson suggests that God is 
speaking to the Messiah in verse 6. 
With this view in mind, read verse 6 
aloud to the group from the Revised 
Standard Version of the Bible.

The Bible indicates that Israel was 
chosen for service as a missionary na­
tion. Have the verses listed in study 
material read for group study starting 
with the call of Abraham in Genesis 
12:3. The covenant was passed on to 
Isaac in Genesis 26:1-5 and Jacob in 
Genesis 28:10-17. The duty of the 
people was explained more fully in 
Exodus 19:5-6. They were to be a 
nation of people to bring man and God 
together. The final fulfilment would 
come in the Messiah as indicated in 
Acts 3:25-26.

The message is to go “unto the end 
of the earth” (49:6). Ask the group 
to name other verses that restate this 
same purpose. Suggest these: Matthew 
28:19; Luke 24:47; Acts 1:8. 

philosophic. A* a result of the situa­
tion, Paul’s speech is a very logical 
step by step presentation.

On the chalkboard number 1 through 
7, leaving a space for seven statements. 
Lead the group to find the logical steps 
in Paul’s presentation. Write the steps 
on the chalkboard. This study aid may 
have the steps listed as:

1. Paul started where the people 
were with the statue to the unknown 
god.

2. God made the world and man.
3. This then is the God to worship.
4. God showed his love for man by 

sending Jesus to be a righteous judge.
5. Since judgement is coming— 

repent.
6. Jesus’ deity was proved by his 

resurrection.
7. Jesus is the world’s only Saviour.
Lead the group to summarize the 

three main truths in this section of the 
Scriptures. They are: one God, one 
world, one Saviour. Ask: Why are 
these truths missionary in their impli­
cation? Do these beliefs effect our 
concern for people of other religions? 
Is it enough to practice just any reli­
gion?

Christ is the only hope. We do need 
to recognize, however, another per­
son's religion for what value it has, 
then go beyond to show that Christ is 
the only Saviour Even Paul did this. 
He did not start by saying, "Why your 
religion is no good! How can you be­
lieve such a thing'" He said instead. 
"You are very religious." (a comple­
ment) and then presented his argument

3. The Church in God's Plan
Ephesians 3:1-13.

Many are saying that the church is 
no longer needed Some have even 
said the church will die and Christian­
ity will continue without it These 
statements lead us to examine again 
the church's purpose. Is it doomed’’ 
Is it no longer needed’’ What church 
attitude should we be careful to avoid2 * * * * * * 9 
Seek answers to these questions as you 
study the place of the church in God's 
plan.

2. One God, One World.
Acts 17:22-31.

The Jews and Greeks held one view
in common. They divided all mankind
into two parts. Each put himself first 
and the rest of the world as "dogs” or
barbarians.

Paul's approach to the Athenians
was different from his address to Jew­
ish audiences. This one was more

Assign a group member to report 
on the background of Ephesians Ask 
her to answer these questions: Who 
wrote Ephesians, from where, and un­
der what conditions? You may add the 
theme of the book (the nature and

mission of the church) as you beghto 
lead the group study.

Ask for group response to this ques­
tion: What was the mystery Paul spota 
of? In your own church, is there aa 
attitude that the church is made up of 
all believers from every sector of hu­
manity?

Dr. Colson states that the church is 
the successor to the Israel of the Old 
Testament. To further support this 
statement, refer to Matthew 21:43. 
Tell the parable recorded in Matthew 
21:33-42 and then read verse 43.

The church in Jerusalem reluctantly 
preached the gospel outside of Judea. 
When it hesitated too long with regard 
to the “uttermost part of the earth," 
the center of activity shifted to Antioch 
in Syria.

We should avoid the attitude that 
leaves us without concern for people 
of other nations, races, social status. 
This is where Israel failed.

4. One Family in God.
Ephesians 3:14-21.

The prayer of Paul recorded in this 
section can be studied in small study 
groups (3 persons). The groups may 
use the following study questions. One 
person should be selected in each group 
to report findings.
1 Do verses 14-15 mean that every 
person or family on earth worships 
God? Give reasons for your answer.
2 List Paul’s various prayer requests.
3 Discuss and state your opinion of 
the missionary implications in verse 
I 8 "with all saints."
4 Does verse 21 say anything about 
the place of the church in God's plan? 
What is implied?

Guide the discussion as the study 
group reports are given. You may 
conclude by referring to articles on 
brotherhood found in current maga­
zines or newspapers.

Summarize in review the evidence 
of God's missionary plan through the 
ages

1 The Messiah—the Saviour for 
all nations

2 Only one God. one world, one 
Saviour

3 The church exists to extend the 
gospel

3 All believing people will makc 
up the family of God

UND TABLE GROUPS

No Space for Spectators
Books for this quarter are grouped around the central idea that God uses men

and events to bring about his missionary purposes. Each month will develop a different sub-theme.

SvB-THf-ME 1: Historically God has used men to fulfil 
his purposes.

Books to read and discuss:

* Luther Rice: Believer in Tomorrow, 
Evelyn Wingo Thompson, Broadman 
Press, $3.95

The John Leland Story, Don M. Fear- 
heiley. Broadman Press

To the Golden Shore, Courtney Ander­
son, Dolphin Books

*The Shoe-Leather Globe, Saxon Rowe 
Carver, Broadman Press. $2.95

(Books above with an asterisk are available from Baptist 
Book Store )

Discussion of Sub-theme
Men have been used throughout missions history to 

fulfil God's grand missionary design Personalities have 
been formed with certain attributes, desires, and drives 
that enable men dynamically to interact in certain social 
groupings and strive for certain goals

Luther Rice was characterized by a certain "aptitude for 
happiness " A certain "resiliency of spirit" kept him going 
in most trying circumstances His adaptability and flexi­
bility enabled him to move easily from one varied social 
situation to another He was willing to face the difficult, 

often making mistakes but always putting his mistakes to 
future use.

John Leland was noted for his independent thought and 
tenacity in sticking to the concepts he held to be true. With 
unusual physical stamina, he had the ability to win his 
battles by the sheer discipline of holding to a certain 
course.

William Carey was characterized by his quick mind and 
his thorough methods of attacking any job. Added to this 
steady approach to work was a contagious enthusiasm for 
foreign missions. His quiet dignity inspired confidence in 
those he worked with and met from day to day.

In his early years, Adoniram Judson seemed to many 
a bookish intellectual. He was obsessed with logic and 
intellectual order. His leaning toward religion was sup­
planted by his ambition for fame. When he later became 
a Christian, he pursued biblical truth and the cause of 
missions with the same complete devotion he had earlier 
accorded academic fame.

Approaches to Study
Use these questions as a basis for group discussion.
I. List personality traits of each of the men men­

tioned above. Consider those factors that molded these 
traits.

a. How did each set of parents influence the devel­
opment of given traits?

b. What other persons had shaping influences on 
these men?

c. What factots or situations in the social structure 
native to each man tempered the development 
of his personality?

2 Choose three events in the career of each man that 
you feel to be most significant in missions history.

a What personality factors contributed to these 
events?

b What previous life circumstances had prepared 
the man for the hour?

3 Determine what you believe to be the major contri­
bution of each man to missions history
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PRAYER GROUPS

RUSSIAN RELIGIOUS
RESTRICTIONS

Mrs. Sam Dunbar, Jr.

THE most exciting religious com­
munity in Russia today is the 

Baptist group,” according to C. Stan­
ley Lowell, editor, of Church and 
State. The 550,000 Baptists seem 
small when compared to approxi­
mately 235 million persons living in 
Russia today. Small groups of Men- 
nonites, Pentecostals, Methodists, 
Adventists, and Lutherans exist in 
Russia, also.

Crowds of people attend the wor­
ship services held each Sunday. Rus­
sian law separating church and state 
is interpreted to prohibit educational 
ministries such as Sunday School, 
youth groups, and women’s societies. 
This prohibition places major em­
phasis on thepworship service as the 
only valid function of the church

Women make up two-thirds of the 
First Baptist Church of Moscow. 
This church reports more than 150 
baptisms a year. Most of these rep­
resent persons over thirty years of 
age. Few young people attend.

Although education and outreach 
are denied, members of officially 
recognized churches enjoy freedom 
of worship. Some members of ‘‘un­
derground churches," however, have 
endured trials and convictions re­
cently “Underground churches" are 
churches that meet informally in 
homes and have never applied to 
the government for formal recogni­
tion. No one knows how many of 
these groups exist. They are pri­

marily Baptist or Pentecostal. Al­
though members of recognized 
churches are sympathetic, they tend 
to think that this movement makes 
government restrictions on church 
life a bit more rigid.

Experiencing Prayer
Think for a moment of the im­

portance of the educational experi­
ence that has shaped your life 
through the church. Consider the 
possibility of children growing up 
without attending Sunday School

Pray for parents living in Russia 
who must provide Bible instruction 
in their homes for their children. Be 
conscious of irregularity of sched­
ules, lack of sharing between chil­
dren of different homes, and the 
inevitable time problem

Pray for families where the fathers 
are not Christian Pray that the 
mothers might be free to instruct 
their children and that they might 
be disciplined in finding the time 
and enthusiasm to do this.

Pray that government officials 
will become more tolerant of persons 
with differing religious views. Pray 
that the lives of these men might be 
touched by the dedication that Chris­
tians exhibit

Think of the young people in Rus­
sia. Try to imagine the things these 
young people desire. What possible 
influences are important in their 
lives? Why are they not challenged

by the church?
Pray that these young people 

might see in the church some an­
swers to their needs.

Pray that Baptist parents of Rus­
sian teen-agers might be more per­
suasive in their demonstration of the 
faith.

Pray that these teen-agers might 
respond.

Think of the freedom with which 
you attend the meetings of your 
church. Consider the freedom that 
is yours to invite friends to your 
home to discuss spiritual matters.

Experience thankfulness for the 
security America affords in the ex­
ercising of religious beliefs.

Question your utilization of that 
freedom Since you are free to pro­
claim, is there more you must do9

Pray for the members of First 
Baptist Church. Moscow Pray for 
the “underground churches." Know­
ing that Christ is in the midst of 
these groups, pray that each mem­
ber might live the fullness of dis­
cipleship

Prayer Possirii itifs
Examine current news magazines 

Make a list of Russian leaders Re­
member to pray each day that the 
Holy Spirit might touch their lives

Read a current article or book 
on Russia Formulate ten prayer 
requests from the knowledge you 
have gained in this study

MISSION ACTION
Appearing each month, this page Is designed for the 

individual participating in a mission acton group or engaging 
In a mission action project. Readers will explore problems faced 

by the Individual who ministers. This month begins a four- 
month series that focuses on four barriers to concern 

mentioned in C. W. Brister’s People Who Care.

Indifference: A Barrier to Concern
Expression

Marsha Newell dashed down the stairs to take the last 
load of clothes from the dryer. Folding the towels, she 
mentally checked off the things she needed to do before 
she picked up the children. She must pick up Bob's brown 
suit from the cleaners and check the shoes she had left 
to be resoled. Then she ought to stop by Johnson’s to find 
some new material to make curtains for Nancy’s room. 
For an instant her thoughts turned to Ted’s room with its 
continual clutter of biological specimens. If only he would 
relate to his classmates better. Of course, Brian goes too 
far, she thought, that boy never wants to do anything but 
socialize Oh yes, she needed to think of the decorations 
for Debbie’s birthday party on Saturday.

Lingering over her last cup of coffee, Karen Martin 
considered her day. Shopping with Edith was always a 
delight Maybe they would go to that new tearoom on 
Twentieth Street for lunch. Actually she had nothing to 
buy since she had been shopping earlier in the week with 
Lorraine. What about Clay—maybe he could use a new 
sport shirt for the weekend outing with the Rushes. Idly 
she wondered, would matching shirts be nice, maybe 
something to wear with navy slacks.

Driving through the narrow streets of the east side of 
town. Marge Callaway and Thelma Rogers were amazed 
at the number of school-age children playing on the side­
walk Knowing that their own children were safely in 
school, they ruled out any possible holiday. “That's just 
like those people; they place no value on a better life," 
Marge commented. "As long as they have a roof over 
their heads, nothing else matters," Thelma returned.

Re Ft FC T1ON
Marsha Newell is plagued by hundreds of details The 

pressure of taking proper care of her family allows little 
time for other matters. This pressure is conceivably a bar­
rier to concern for persons outside her family circle. Karen 
Martin is preoccupied with a life she enjoys. She is prob­
ably unaware of the fact that all her activities center around 
herself The natural self-interest she manifests keeps her 
from the richer pleasure of service. Both Marge Callaway 
and Thelma Rogers simply fail to see the needs other 
persons may have Viewing the children from the car, they 

are insensitive to the facts of the case. Perhaps the chil­
dren would have been in school if they had had suitable 
shoes, if they had not become discouraged by teachers 
who had little time to give them needed help in keeping 
up with the other children, or if the children in their 
classes had made an effort to include them in play.

Application
Pressure, self-interest, and insensitivity arc common to 

most people at least in some form. The fact remains, how­
ever, that the indifference they produce blocks concern 
for others. Consider the following questions to understand 
and handle your persona] indifference to the needs of your 
community.

I How much free time do you have each week?
2. What measures could you develop to allow yourself 

more free time?
3. What parts of your regular routine could be elimi­

nated?
4 What actions that meet the needs of others can you 

name that are more important than the items listed in 
number 3?

5. List the major activities of the past week. How many 
of these concerned only yourself? How many contributed 
to the lives of others?

6. What are the three most important things you wish 
to do next month? Do these reflect self-interest?

7. Ride across town, sit in a bus station, or park your 
car on a busy street. Choose any three people. Practice 
sensitivity to their needs Let your imagination explore all 
possible ideas.

8 Read a local newspaper imagining that you are the 
main character in any one news story. As this character, 
whal emotions do you feel; what are your needs; what 
would you like someone to do for you?

9 What barriers to concern does your ministry face? 
Rate yourself

_ self-interest
___ failure to see other’s needs 
___personal pressures 
_ others

10 List three possible ways to overcome your biggest 
barrier
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THOUGHTS

From a rocking chair . . .
I wish I could put Mickey down 

this time without his waking. He's 
so feverish and heavy against my 
body and my arms are throbbing. 
I’ve rocked an hour and ten min­
utes—no, an hour and twenty min­
utes—and every time I stir to get out 
of this chair and put him in his crib, 
he cries. If he’d just stay sound 
asleep this time.

How I wish Mother were here. 
She could show me what I'm doing 
wrong. But I know she can’t afford 
to come, and we sure don’t have the 
money to send her for a ticket, with 
Mickey’s medicine and all.

Hush, hush, now. Mommy’s go­
ing to rock you some more. How 
will I get the formula made? And 
the diapers? There are just three 
left. If only we’d lived here long 
enough to make some friends.

From a barstool . . .
“Nobody loves a stinkin' nasty 

drunk." That’s the last thing he said 
to me. Then he was gone. My 
Jerry was gone. With his suitcase. 
In a taxi. I ain’t seen him since. 
Can’t blame him much. He tried. 
I know he tried to love me for the 
way I used to be when he’d come 
home from work with the house 
cleaned spotless and my hair 
brushed shiny. But I ain’t been like 
that for such a long time.

From the kitchen . . .
I just wish someone would come 

to cat with me. I know it's silly, 
but I’m so lonely. So very lonely. 
Just this one supper. The very worst 
thing since Sonny was killed is eat­
ing alone. At least that’s the worst 
part for me.

I’ve tried to watch TV and eat, 
but it’s always Huntley-Brinkley 
time and they have those battle 
scenes from Vietnam. Every time 1 
see a man fall, I think: Where’s his 
wife? Where’s his mother? Is her 
heart aching, too? Did she sec this? 
Does she know already?

I loved mealtime with Sonny. He 
always had to have mashed potatoes 
and gravy. He'd have eaten them 
for breakfast if I’d fixed them for 
him.

I wonder what he had to eat those 
last few weeks in Vietnam. Was he 
lonely? Was he frightened? It’s not 
that I'm not proud of him. I am 
proud But being proud doesn't 
make me less lonely Especially not 
at suppertime

Elizabeth Swadley

Why didn't Jerry understand 
about the drinking? I wanted that 
baby so much and made all those 
soft, small things for him. Then he 
was bom dead. Why did that have 
to happen?

It’s so crowded here. And I'm 
so lonely. They don’t notice me. 
All those folks at tables, laughing 
and carrying on above their clinking 
glasses. They laugh so loud Too 
loud. And the music. It’s too loud, 
too.

What might the involvement

of one Christian mean to

these women?

A regular feature each month. Kaleidoscope will keep 
you informed of pertinent news of your denomination 
and possibilities of interest for your WMU. Kaleidoscope 
can be defined as a variegated changing pattern or scene. 
The pattern of Southern Baptist activity will be changing 
this year. The changing movement of life will bring new 
possibilities to Baptist women. Keep informed by turning 
to this page each month.

“Our ultimate objective is to establish a new church in 
every place in the nation where one is needed,” states 
Loyd Corder, associate director. Division of Missions, 
Home Mission Board. This goal calls for 3,600 new 
churches by 1973.

And what do Baptist Men do at their meetings? They 
study missions just like you do. Fall quarter they will 
study ‘‘Man's Role in God’s Missionary Plan” in an effort 
to understand some of the ways God uses man to com­
municate his redemptive plan to the world. During the 
winter and spring quarters they will examine urbanization, 
race relations, generation tensions, and the special needs 
of students, alcoholics, and transients under the theme, 
“Missions: Every Christian’s Responsibility." Summer 
will find the men concentrating on rural, inner city, and 
suburban churches. Using the theme, “The Church Ex­
pressing Missions.” they will study ways the contemporary 
church faces its problems.

The Foreign Mission Board has a limited supply of 
leader's mission study resource booklets for the Graded 
senes studies of 1966, 1967, and 1968 Although each 
church library received a copy during the year the booklet 
was produced, these may have been lost. Suggest that

P|ease send my Pact partner a one (1) year subscription to ROYAL SERVICE
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jift announcement to Pact partner
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your church librarian obtain copies of these free resource 
materials helpful in planning society and current mission 
study sessions.

New Mission Fields in Asia
Africa—Continent of New Nations 
Spanish America—Lands of Progress

Order these free from Foreign Mission Board, Literature 
Distribution, P. O. Box 6597, Richmond, Virginia 23230.

On October 1, 1970, Southern Baptist churches will 
begin using a new grouping-grading plan which calls for 
boys six to eight years of age to receive their education in 
missions through Crusader Royal Ambassadors. At the 
same time Royal Ambassador curriculum materials will 
begin providing instruction in missions for six- to eight- 
year-old boys. A carefully prepared plan for making this 
change in churches has been designed by the Brotherhood 
Commission and Woman’s Missionary Union.

Use WMS Member Handbook—Changes and Choices 
to enlist new members. Betty Lynn Cadle, executive sec­
retary of Colorado Woman’s Missionary Union, suggests 
below some enlistment ideas you might like to try.

Twenty-five cents invested in a gift copy of Changes 
and Choices can greatly affect the life of its recipient. Ac­
company the gift with a personal visit.

Give Changes and Choices to single young women being 
promoted from YWA into WMS. Invite them to general 
WMS meetings and tell them of WMS missions groups.

Include Changes and Choices in packet of materials 
for new church members of WMS age group. Be sure 
each new woman receives a personal invitation to become 
a part of the work of your WMS

You have prayed with her; you have shared 

something of your life, your bond of fellowship 

has deepened Show your appreciation for the 

meaning of this relationship by sending a gift 
subscription of ROYAL SERVICE to your 
Enghsh-speaking Pact partner

31
30



A REGULAR feature each month, 
Spectrum is a type of editorial 

page. The name gives some hint to its 
intent. A spectrum is an array of the 
components of an emission sepa­
rated and arranged in the order of 
some varying characteristic. The 
display of colors formed when a 
beam of sunlight filters through a 
prism is a good example of a spec­
trum. This page then is to act as a 
prism separating and arranging the 
components of the magazine, world 
affairs, and human experience 
around a dominant theme or idea.

For example, October Royal 
Service was planned around the 
idea “No Space for Spectators.” This 
theme suggests that the Christian 
faith has no room for persons who 
sit on the sidelines and watch others. 
Rather, Christians should ail be 
players, persons deeply involved in 
the corporate effort of spreading the 
faith.

Dynamic missions involvement is 
illustrated by the lives of persons 
featured this month Luther Rice 
was totally obsessed with leading 
Baptists to support world missions 
with prayer, money, and lives Etha- 
lee Hamnc. former editor of Royal 
Service, has devoted a career to 
communicating missions concepts 
■nd information to Baptist women

W Kesner uses hours of leisure 
time to minister to the deaf Alwar

Sundell has actively involved him. 
self in Finland’s political and reli­
gious life in an effort to demonstrate 
his response to Christ. Mrs. R. L. 
Mathis has involved her life dynami­
cally in the purposes of Woman’s 
Missionary Union, the Southern 
Baptist Convention, and the Baptist 
World Alliance.

This church year marks the 125th 
Anniversary of the Southern Baptist 
Convention. Desire for involvement 
has been a Baptist distinctive. Con­
tinuing the concern of Luther Rice, 
early Southern Baptists formed their 
Convention on the dual imperative 
of home and foreign missions. Wom­
an's Missionary Union has always 
fostered the involvement of women 
in mission support, a type of involve­
ment that was begun by Rice’s ‘‘fe­
male mite societies.”

Royal Service follows the Rice 
tradition, too. Rice was responsible 
for The Latter Day Luminary, a 
journal to inform the Triennial Con­
vention about missions advance. Be­
ginning a new church year. Royal 
Service renews its pledge to you. 
the reader It is the intention of this 
magazine to involve the reader dy­
namically in missions education, sup­
port. and action. You are invited 
to become involved in meeting this 
goal through your readership, your 
personal response, and your com­
munication with the editor

ectrum

PREPARED BY MARGARET BRUCE
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intta i>rvxith,itl
Congratulations on your opportunity to serve as WMS 

president in your church. You've been elected because 
there arc those in your church who have confidence in 
your ability to lead Each month Forecaster will help 
you and other WMS officers to plan and conduct WMS 
work Form the habit of using Forecaster regularly.

WMS Executive Committee
Plan
1 Check with the WMS study chairman to be sure 

that plans have been made for the October general WMS 
meeting You may want to make this study shorter than 
usual in order to preview the 1969-70 WMS plans. Sec 
WMU Year Book 1969-70 <3S« ).*

2 Check with the WMS activity chairman to be sure 
that plans have been made for the prayer time, using Call 
to Prayer in Roy At Service. You will also want to be 
certain that a mission action project (s) for the society has 
been planned

3 Schedule time for the study chairman to confer with 
study leaders and the activity chairman to confer with 
the prayer and mission action group leaders During this 
period the activity chairman and the study chairman can 
check with group leaders about plans for missions group 
meetings

Coordinate
1 As the study chairman and the activity chairman 

report on work they have done, plans can be coordinated 
to avoid conflicts and duplication

2 As group leaders report, group plans can be coordi­
nated with society plans

October General WMS Meeting
I he October general W MS meeting is a most important 

ime Some of the items you will include on your agenda 
arc Hi recognition of new members. (2) preview of 
1969-70 goals and plans, (3) introduction of WMS offi­

cers (you may want to ask the officers to present their 
plans for the year as a part of the preview); (4) presenta­
tion of missions group opportunities through WMS; (5) 
study session, “A Spark Catches Fire" (sec p. 16); (6) 
Promotional Feature (sec this Forecaster, p. 35).

Member Orientation
Here are some things you can do to prepare WMS 

members for the new year.
1 Sec that each member knows of missions group op­

portunities to be offered by your W'MS
2 See that group members sign up for the same mis­

sions group!s) or choose another
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3. See that each WMS member chooses a missions 
group or, if members have no preference, assign them to 
a group.

4 Close the year by reminding group members again 
of their responsibilities as group members (sec pp. 96-98, 
WMS Leader Manual, 75<*.' and pp. 13-16, Leading a 
WMS Group,

Missions Groups
If WMS members prefer being assigned to a missions 

group, assign them. Stud) material used by current mis­
sions groups is similar tothat which was formerly used 
by circles and is found in Royal Service each month. 
This may be the group which will appeal to members 
who do not want to choose a missions group for them­
selves.

Enlisting New Members
The enlisting of WMS prospects is the responsibility 

of the WMS president and the missions group leaders 
Since October begins a new WMU year it is an appropriate 
time for special enlistment efforts. See the W MS Leader 
Manual and Kaleidoscope, p 31. for suggestions

Additional Officers and Leaders
The new WMS organization plan was recommended to 

simplify WMS work and to provide flexibility in organiza­
tions needing it If additional officers are needed the 
society will elect them and decide how the work is to be 
divided and assigned.

Some societies may elect three chairmen instead of 
two—a study chairman, a mission support chairman (for 
promotion of prayer and offerings), and a mission action 
chairman

It is possible that some missions groups may want assis­
tant group leaders The group may decide to elect someone 
to plan for use of the calendar of prayer at meetings, 
someone to preview the general WMS study topic for the 
coming month, or someone to plan mission action projects 
to be conducted The group planning charts in the H MS 
Leader Manual (pp 113-115) show work which needs to 
be done by volunteers or by persons elected to assist the
leader

irnia fhairnivn
All society plans are coordinated in the WMS executive 

committee The study chairman and the activity chairman 
bring their plans to the committee for coordination

The plan sheets based on the WMS Achievement Guide 
which are in the WML’ Year Book (35e)' will be helpful 
in making broad plans for the year Detailed plans need 
io be made regularly Activities which need to be planned 
for October by the study chairman and the activity chair­
man are listed below

WMS chairmen will’be aware of assistance which they 
need to give to missions group leaders this month. So* 
of the items you will want to discuss with them are:

1. Selecting or electing assistant group leaders. The* 
could be persons to help with enlistment and other group 
activities.

2. Using materials and resources which are available 
for group leaders and members.

3. Acquainting them with the WMS Group Record and 
Report Book (30$).’

4. Using group plan sheets as suggested in the WMS 
Leader Manual (75$).' See pages 113-115; you may have 
these duplicated for group leaders.

5. Involving all group members in planning and con­
ducting the work of the group.

6. Using Royal Service and Forecaster as regular 
resources.

WMS Study Chairman
October's Study
Determine the methods you will use to present the study 

material on page 16. The guide, page 19, will help in 
planning this study session. The aim of this month's study, 
"A Spark Catches Fire,” is: What can I recognize in the 
modern missionary movement as evidences of God's use 
of events in history to expand man’s involvement in his 
missions plan9 You will pray that this month's study will 
lead members to be more personally involved in missions 
at home and abroad Suggest to WMS members that they 
read the article on page 8, “Luther Rice: A Yankee with 
Southern Followers." in preparation for the October study.

Foreign Mission Graded Senes
The theme for the 1969 Foreign Mission Graded Series 

is The Middle East " The Adult book is Sons of Ishmael: 
How Shall They Hear'’ by Finlay M Graham (95$).’ 
The book is a study of the Arabs in the area often called 
the Holy Land and of the work of Southern Baptist mis­
sionaries in that area Dr Graham is president of the 
Arab Baptist Theological Seminary near Beirut. Lebanon

In addition to the Teacher's Guide (40$ )2 other mate­
rials will be available Some of these are

Filmstrip "Baptist Witness in the Middle East." 40 
frames with recording, manual. S6.002

Filmstrip "Challenge of the Arab World." 40 frames 
with recording, manual. $6 (X)2

Slide set eight color slides to be used with the Adult 
book. $3 00-'

"The Middle East Arena of World Concern." a leaders 
mission study resource booklet, free3

If the Foreign Mission Graded Series is not taught in 
your church as a churchwide study you will make plans 
for it to be studied by WMS members

Activity Chairman
At October General WMS Meeting
Your responsibility is to plan Jor the prayer time at 

general WMS meetings. This time can be a most meaning­
ful experience for WMS members. By using Call to Prayer 
at general meetings, members will be encouraged to use 
the calendar of prayer daily. At this time group leaders 
will also be reminded of opportunities which group meet­
ings afford for leading members to pray for missionaries 
on their birthdays.

The October birthstone is an opal and the flower is a 
calendula. You may use these two items to remind WMS 
members of missionaries having birthdays on the day of 
your meeting. The opal is a beautiful jewel with iridescent 
colors and the calendula is a small yellow flower. The 
calendula and the opal seem appropriate for use this month 
since they both remind us of light. Our missionaries go to 
the uttermost parts of the earth to take the Light of the 
one who said: "I am come a light into the world, that 
whosoever believeth on me should not abide in darkness" 
(John 12 46).

Cooperative Program Month
Cixiperative Program Month is designed to help churches 

tell members about the Cooperative Program. The study 
course books. Our Cooperative Program (95$ )2 and Prin­
ciples of Stewardship Development (95$),2 both by W. E. 
Grindstaff, give information which may be used in inform­
ing members of the Southern Baptist plan of supporting 
our work throughout the world. This special emphasis 
could mean a larger percentage of your church's funds to 
world missions through the Cooperative Program during 
the coming year.

Conserving the Crusade of the Americas
Many will be tempted to feel that the Crusade is over 

after the 1969 campaigns have been completed This 
should not be the case The Crusade will continue, in some 
instances, beyond 1969 Spiritual processes arc not always 
governed by the calendar Emphasis must continue to be 
given throughout 1970 on conserving the results. This can 
he done only through prayer and a continuation of the 
purposes of the Crusade

1 a deepening of the spiritual life within the churches, 
homes, and individual Christians

2 (he evangelizing of persons on the American con­
tinents

’ the establishment of true moral and spiritual bases 
for the betterment of mankind's welfare

AMS Mission Action for October
What are the needs of your community ’ Are there 

mission action groups which need society help with some 
ongoing mission action'.’

Are there deaf persons in your community who need a 
ministry'’ Read the article on page 14

I he article on page 30 by Elizabeth Swadley may open 
your eyes to needs in your community which your WMS 
may supply

tints group It'ttilers
Additional leaders

Some missions groups have decided that they need as­
sistant group leaders. If this has been the experience of 
your group, elect or appoint assistant group leaders to be 
responsible for certain phases of the work.

Assistant group leaders may be needed to plan for use 
of calendar of prayer at meetings, to plan for mission 
action projects, or other related activities. When assistant 
group leaders are not elected for specific work, members 
will volunteer at planning meetings. See planning charts in 
WMS Leader Manual (75/),* pages 113-115.

Preview November General WMS Study Topic
The November general WMS study topic is “Significant 

Migrations." Ask the question, What does the word mi­
grate mean? Have someone prepared to give this definition; 
"to move from one country, place, or locality to another."

Ask this question: From what country or location in 
America did your forefathers come? After several answers 
have been given, say Through the years there have been 
migrations of people—from Europe to the United States, 
from the USA to Europe, and within the United States. 
At the November WMS meeting we will explore events 
which have broadened and limited Southern Baptist mis­
sions work in Europe and among language groups of 
European origin here in the United States. Don’t miss 
this interesting study.

Give time and place of meeting and arrange transpor­
tation for members if necessary.

Promotional Feature
Announce the time and place of (he study of the Foreign 

Mission Graded Senes txxik. Sons of Ishmael. How Shall 
Thev Hear’’ (95$) 2 You may want to have copies of the 
book to circulate among members to read and be prepared 
for the study

You may want to have the group unscramble the follow­
ing letters or to fill in spaces to discover what the study 
is about

tistabp essitnw gonam asarb m eht leddim tase
or

Baptist among . in the —-----------

(Baptist witness among Arabs in the Middle East)

Study Group Ix-ader
It is important that the mission study group leader have 

a clearly defined goal or aim for each study experience. 
Fo illustrate

Current Missions Group
Topic Unacdaimed Disciples
Aim- To help members

• appreciate the value of an individual
• sec how God uses individuals to do his work in 

today's world
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• become aware of ways God can use them and 
other Christians to do his work

Bible Study Group
Topic—God’s Plan of the Ages
Aim—To help members understand God’s missionary 

purpose and plan:
1. the Messiah, the Saviour for all nations
2. one God, one world, one Saviour
3. the church exists to extend the gospel
4. all believers make up the family of God 

Round Table Group
Review—Group chooses book from Round Table 

Group Guide ($ 1)1 or from materials for Round 
Table groups in Royal Service, page 27.

Aim—If book chosen for review is a book on Africa, 
the aim might be: to discover how Africa’s push 
toward self-determination has significant bearing 
on missions work.

Mission Books Group
Study—Group chooses book from Mission Books 

Teacher's Guide 1 (SI)1 or Mission Books Teach­
ers Guide II, 1969-71 ($ 1) ’

Aim—If the book chosen for study is on Taiwan, the 
aim might be: to learn about Taiwan, its location 
and geography, its people, their need for the gospel, 
and ways it is being proclaimed.

Prayer Group Leader
See page 28 for prayer requests Ask certain group 

members to bring to prayer group meeting prayer requests 
of missions needs they have found by reading Royal 
Service, The Commission, Home Missions, state Baptist 
papers, or local newspapers.

To tie group members more securely to all WMS activ­
ities, bring prayer requests from executive committee and 
from society meeting to group members. Urge members 
to pray for these needs during intervening days. Ask mem­
bers to share answered prayer experiences with group 
members.

To vary prayer experiences, see “Directed Prayer." 
page 14, Prayer Group Guide ($!),' and discuss "My 
Church and Missions." (See p. 24. Prayer Group Guide 
for suggestions.)

Mission Action Group leader
In order for the mission action group to do its work 

most effectively it is important that the group use its pri­
mary resource, the mission action group guide Mission 
action groups choose the guide related to the area in which 
they are working—internationals, language groups, the 
sick, economically disadvantaged, etc. See the WMU Year 
Book 1969-70 (35«i)’ for a list of the twelve mission 
action group guides which are now available.

Groups forming for the first time will follow the launch 
actions outlined in the group guides. New members com­
ing into the group will need to study carefully this section 
of the guide.

Refer group members to “Indifference: A Barrier to 
Concern,” page 29.

promotions!I fenturo
for WMS

Last year the WMS at First Baptist Church, Nashville 
Tennessee, presented missions group opportunities in a 
very attractive way. They made slides of each missions 
group they were planning to offer. For the Round Table 
group they used a slide showing some of the Round Table 
books; for the current missions group and the Bible study 
group, they used a slide of Royal Service. For the prayer 
group they had a slide of Diirer’s Praying Hands; for mis­
sion action groups they used slides showing persons of 
special need and various places where groups would be 
ministering and witnessing.

A tape explained the pictures and the groups to be 
offered. In addition to the slides and the tape, a little 
booklet and a mimeographed sheet gave the name of group 
leaders and space for women to sign up for the group(s) 
of their choice. A place was given for women to give their 
preference for time and place of meetings. The presenta­
tion was called: How Big Is Your World?

You will want to plan an attractive presentation of 
WMS missions group opportunities in your church. Per­
haps you can plan one similar to the one described above.

This month the WMS committee will be involved in 
making plans for the study of the 1969 Foreign Mission 
Graded Series book. Sons of Ishmael How Shall They 
Hear’’ (95<t)z by Finlay M. Graham There are various 
ways the book may be studied

• churchwide study
• single society study
• joint society study
Regardless of how the book is to be studied in your 

church, consider the possibility of sharing certain resources. 
These may include leadership, finances, materials, facil­
ities, publicity, etc See the WMS study chairman section 
in this Forecaster for some materials which may be shared

Sources for Materials l isted in WMS Forecaster

'Available from Woman's Missionary L’nion. 600 North Twen­
tieth Street. Birmingham. Alabama 35203. or Baptist Book Store

"Available from Baptist Book Store only
3Available free from Foreign Mission Board. I iterature Distri­

bution. P O Box 6597. Richmond. Virginia 23230

W: WHO TRUIY I
ie Whitlow 1 1.ads;

SO you have been elected to a 
place of leadership in Woman's 

Missionary Union. Don't throw up 
your hands in dismay this early in 
October Take heart You have 
many friends who arc eager to assist 
you in your leadership undertaking 
and there are many printed helps 
available to leaders

The fact that you are called a 
leader means that you have been se­
lected to a leadership position which 
requires that you perform a service 
with a group in such a way as to help 
them to further the purpose of their 
group This may mean you are the 
WMU director leading the WMU 
council in the total work of Woman's 
Missionary Union, an age-level di­
rector guiding age-level leaders as 
they plan, coordinate, and evaluate 
organization work, an age-level lead­
er molding the lives of youth, a 
WMS officer leading women in 
learning, ministering, and witnessing 
experiences Regardless of your job. 
you are a leader, and being a leader 
demands that all the resources of 
your life be made available to the 
group You are working with peo­
ple to accomplish particular tasks 
and it behooves you to strive to be­

come the best leader that you are 
capable of becoming.

Now that you are a leader, how 
do you become an effective leader?

Read the following statements; 
register your agreement or disagree­
ment; continue by reading the article; 
check again the statements to deter­
mine whether you have the same at­
titude. analyze your leadership skills, 
list your strengths and weaknesses, 
make some commitments; embark 
upon a delightful twelve-month 
course of leadership

1 In Womans Missionary 
Union leaders assist one an 
Other

2 Leaders are born leaders

3 A leader must set a good 
example

4 A democrats leader dele 
gates responsibility

5 Delegating requires taking 
r SkS

6 Leadmg hard work

7 The good leader is a good 
tear her

8 The results of one's leader 
ship are no! to he determined

by what the leader achieves, 
but rather by what she enables 
the group to achieve

9 The best leader is the one 
who can stimulate the group 
to its maximum performance.

yes no

10 A leader can improve her 
leadership performance.

"He is a born leader.” is an ex­
pression often heard but which ap­
pears to be nothing more than a 
myth. Leadership is not simply 
having been born with a certain gift. 
I cadetship qualities can be devel­
oped and strengthened Although 
no one is sure what calls forth a 
leader, leaders do have definite rec­
ognizable traits.

Leading is hard work. Leading 
means bearing the brunt of respon­
sibility To be a good leader is not 
easy It means trying to influence 
others so that they want to take their 
own share of responsibility and en­
joy their part of the load.

The leader's relationship to the 
group is that of servant and not of 
master She masters the skills of 
leadership so that she can help the 
group to achieve its purposes most 
effectively, not so that she can enjoy
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THE LEADER WHO TRULY Id; ADS

the power of manipulating a group, 
nor so that she can gain personal 

. prestige.
p A leader must find a £g*jrse to 

pursue, be convinced that it is right, 
and then be able to lead others to 
follow in the course to accomplish 
tasks.

A leader who dictates does not 
allow persons in the group to be­
come themselves because she cannot 
help them with the process of inter­
acting and sharing.

A leader who draws the group 
members to her in personal devotion 
does not lead the group to accom­
plish its goal because purposes are 
lost behind the leader.

A permissive leader does not lead 
a group to develop because her lack 
of leadership causes members to be 
confused.

The democratic, group-oriented 
leader provides guidance rather than 
close supervision and her concern is 
the effective use of human resources 
through participation.

The results of one's leadership 
are not to be determined by what 
the leader achieves, but rather by 
what he enables the group to achieve 
The best leader is the one who can 
stimulate the group to its maximum 
performance To allow the members 
of a group a vital share in defining 
and achieving purposes and policies 
seems the only wise way. The proof 
of leading is in the qualitative growth 
of the led as individuals and as group 
members.

What is your style of leadership?
A person’s style of leadership to 

a large degree depends upon her 
personality. The leader who is 
loved, admired, and trusted can in­
fluence the group. The leader who 
is not liked or trusted by the group 
usually cannot influence the group 
except through her authority While 

it may be difficult to change a per­
son's basic style of leadership, there 
are ways to improve one's leadership 
performance. Simply having good 
leadership traits is not enough. True 
leadership principles must be dem­
onstrated. “Follow the leader” is 
more than a mere game. A leader 
must set a good example.

What are some things you need 
to do to increase your effectiveness 
as a leader?

The effective leader will display 
a warm, friendly, relaxed, apprecia­
tive attitude at all times. Genuine 
friendship and affection for people 
make it easy for the leader to gam 
cooperation People need to be led 
to see that they can disagree and 
still work together harmoniously

A leader should learn to distri­
bute among members the opportu­
nity to perform certain leadership 
functions A democratic leader dele­
gates Delegation requires taking 
risks It is not always easy to turn a 
job over to someone else, nor is it 
easy to give someone a task and not 
check on it until its completion- 
others don't always do it as well as 
you would Many leaders complain 
of being overworked when (heir 
problem is failure to delegate tasks 
to co-workers Leaders must have a 
wholesome attitude toward those to 
whom they delegate This attitude 
should convey the concept of sur­
render without resignation

A leader needs to tailor ideas and 
suggestions so that they will best fit 
the needs, desires, abilities, and 
available time of the members

Responsibility for fostering an at­
mosphere which encourages individ­
uals to contribute ideas within the 
group is peculiarly upon the shoul­
ders of the leader

Every leader should be trained 
to listen to the person he would 

lead, for only in this way will he 
understand their individual interests, 
motives, convictions, and scale of 
values. A sensitive leader listens at­
tentively to what each participant 
says, does not evaluate or criticize 
comments, radiates warmth and con­
cern to all group members, and helps 
the person who is having difficulty 
in expressing an idea.

The good leader is a good teacher. 
The role of the leader is much like 
that of a teacher in helping students 
through experiences which bring 
changed minds and motives. The 
good teacher creates within studepts 
desire to learn; the good leader gen­
erates a willingness to be led and a 
sense of its promise and value for 
the followers.

The good leader has faith—faith 
in people as well as faith in God. 
fhe demand for a spiritual faith has 
always been realized by the greatest 
leaders. The leader who experiences 
this kind of faith experiences a mar­
gin of strength and influence un­
known to other leaders.

Good communication is essential 
to effective leadership In communi­
cation the leader is making her ideas 
and her feelings known to her fol­
lowers

I he successful use of group meet­
ings depends on the skill of the lead­
er l eaders will plan in advance the 
agenda of matters to be covered 
and. as far as practical, information 
about agenda items and any support­
ing information will be supplied in 
advance to all group members.

A leader can grow in her ability 
to plan, to involve members in the 
work, to evaluate, and in the means 
she uses to help the organization ful­
fil its purpose Good leadership not 
only increases the amount of work 
done, but can assure spiritual growth 
and blessing for participants as well

Leadership is not a mystical some­
thing which some persons have and 
other do not It is learned behavior 
A person can master the skills by 
proper study and application

Why not begin this year deter­
mined to be the leader who truly 
leads

wmu
leader

planned by june whitlow 
edited by ethalee hamric

October 1969 • royal service

WMU Watchword for 1969-70

Our love should not be just words 
and talk; it must be true love, 
which shows itself In action." 
1 John 3:18 TEV

information for
WMU

council members

Did You Know That

by the year 2000 another hun­
dred million people will be a part of 
this nation?

participation in church life will 
decline if present trends continue?

fantastic advances in medical 
science will bring new problems and 
increase the magnitude of old ones?

there will still be. even with 
all our prosperity, masses of people 
living in the culture of poverty?

How will Southern Baptists take 
positive initiative in forming home, 
church, community, and world life 
during the years before us’

Recognizing the importance and 
characteristics of our times, the 
Southern Baptist Convention has 
planned to meet the opportunities 
this era presents The denomination's 
emphasis for 1969-70 is Living the 
spirit of Christ in Belief and Rele­
vance The emphasis is designed to 
lead the individual to live the spirit 
of Christ in vital faith Major atten­
tion will be given to interpreting 
basic truths of the gospel to others.

The late days of 1969 and the days 
of 1970 offer challenging approaches 
for the churches to act in God's will 
in Shaping the 70 s

Cooperative Program Month

Cooperative Program Month pro­
vides opportunity for informing
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Southern Baptists about their mis­
sion support plan and to pray for 
specific causes.

What can WMU officers do during 
this month to guide the stewardship 
development of WMU members’

1. Suggest that age-leurfHeaders 
use the information in age-level 
magazines this month to acquaint 
members with the work of the Co­
operative Program

2 Work with the Director of 
Library Services in the church in 
setting up a display on the Coopera­
tive Program in the church library

3 Make posters to remind persons 
to pray for the work represented in 
the Cooperative Program alloca­
tions. Place posters m strategic loca­
tions in the church.

4 Encourage persons to read and 
study Our Cooperative Program by 
W E. Grindstaff and Principles of 
Stewardship Development by W E 
Grindstaff These books are avail­
able from Baptist Book Stores

The WMU Leader—What Is It?

• A woman who went to Ridge­
crest and found out all the answers 
about WMU’

• A magazine for WMU leaders’
• A woman who does all the WMU 

work in a church’
■ A manual on WMU work’
No. it happens not to be any one 

of these Well, what is it’
• A special section for WMU offi­

cers in Royal Service
• Denominational information for 

WMU council members
• WMU information for council 

members.
• Specific suggestions for WMU 

director as she directs the work of 
Woman's Missionary Union in a 
church.

• Specific suggestions for WMS, 
YWA. GA. and Sunbeam Band di­
rectors as they represent age-level 
organizations on the council

• An information-packed section 
which you cannot do without'

As a Council Member, Just What 
Should You Do?

Serving on the WMU council dur­
ing the challenging days which lie 
ahead is an awesome responsibility. 
To be able to carry on effective 
WMU work, you need to understand 
thoroughly your task and its rela­
tionship to the total missions en­
deavor in your church. Officers need 
to take advantage of every oppor­
tunity to learn creative ways to keep 
missions before the church.

As you begin your year of service 
on the WMU council, here are four 
suggestions which may prove help­
ful to you

1 Take the WMU Leadership 
Course by class study or individual 
study (see pp 81-83, WMU Manual, i

2 Read the leadership article. 
"It Works This Way WMU Coun­
cil. That Is," page 43. September 1969 
Royal Service After you have read 
that article, then answer the follow­
ing questions

(1 ' What is the purpose of the 
WMU council’

(2> Why is regular planning im­
portant’

(3> What are my duties as a coun­
cil member’

(4 > What kind of council mem- I 
ber am I’

<5’ What preparation do I need | 
to make for the October 
council meeting’

3 Pray lhat you will be sensitive 
to the leadership of the Holy Spirit I 
as you plan missions activities for 
the year

4 If you are the director or as­
sistant director, read "WMU Direc­
tor, Take Note" below If you are 
an age-level director, read “Direc­
tors. Take Note." page 41

To: WMU Director and 
Assistant Director

WMU Director. Take Note

As WMU director you should 
come to the council meeting with a 

basic understanding of all phases of 
the work of Woman's Missionary 
Union. You need to help the council 
see WMU work in its wholeness. 
Helping each member understand 
her responsibility for planning and 
implementation is an important as­
signment of yours. You bring to the 
council needed information about 
church activities, the association, 
state, and national emphases which 
relate to WMU work in the church.

Because one of the features of the 
WMU organization introduced in 
1968 was the separation of WMU and 
WMS officers, you have more time 
and energy to give to the work of 
the whole organization. Special em­
phasis can be placed on churchwide 
activities which involve all church 
members in missions. Through you. 
WMU can be involved in planning 
what the church will do to meet its 
needs You are able to serve on plan­
ning groups and make decisions 
which affect WMU This kind of 
planning and involving all church 
program organizations in the work 
of the church demands much of your 
time

The WMS director and WMS pres­
idents are valuable assets at this 
point because by their involvement 
they free you of many of the details 
which in the past have consumed 
much of your time Working with a 
director in each age-level organiza­
tion assures that you will have an 
accurate picture of the work which 
goes on in those organizations while 
not being burdened with details 
You are equally concerned with al) 
age-level organizations and each 
gets its proper share of attention in 
the WMU council

Planning the First WMU Council 
Meeting

The October council meeting will 
set the pace for the remainder of 
the year, therefore, you should take 
great pains to make it the very best 

Because there is much to do this 
month, plan the meeting at a time 
when you are not rushed. Begin on 
time; close on time.

Arrange the room neatly. A table 
and comfortable chairs are assets. 
A chalkboard may prove helpful. 
Visual aids are impressive, too.

Help all members feel at ease 
You may want to begin the meeting 
by having each member tell some­
thing about herself—her hobby, a 
favorite food, a recent trip—some­
thing which will create an informal 
atmosphere.

Let members know what you will 
expect of them during the year Help 
them to understand that they are to 
be involved in the work of the coun­
cil and at times you may ask them 
to prepare special assignments in 
addition to their regular report As­
sure them that you will let them 
know in plenty of time for adequate 
preparation, Try to use all members 
at some time during the year, but 
be careful not to embarrass anyone

Do not cut off discussion, but keep 
things moving Make decisions and 
move to the next item

These are a few simple things 
which you can do to insure a better 
working relationship between you 
and your council

Council Agenda

Before the council meeting
1 Write the four statements under 

Did You Know That," page 39, on
pieces of paper or on the chalkboard

2 Secure copies of The WMU 
Leader and cut the appropriate sec­

remind them of the sections they 
should use (411 members should 
read "Information for WMU Council 

nients in “Did You Know That" and

tell what your church is planning to 
do to meet each of these challenges.

2. Plan how you will feature the 
Cooperative Program this month.

3. Give appropriate section of The 
WMU Leader to officers. Explain 
what kind of information each sec­
tion includes and who should read 
and use it in contacts and planning 
meetings.

4. Discuss the duties of each mem­
ber of the WMU council. (See WMU 
Manual, chap. 3.) Lead members to 
discover ways they can become in­
volved in each council meeting

5 Make other plans as necessary

To: Secretary-Treasurer
Lend Your Assistance

Work with the WMU director in 
coordinating the ordering of all 
WMU materials Doing this at the 
beginning of the year will keep you 
from having to place so many orders 
during the year and it will assure 
leaders of having all necessary ma­
terials when they are needed

Each age-level director is respon- 

w’hich leaders need A materials 
checklist is given on page 41 to serve 
as a beginning for the director 
These are only basic materials, 
leaders are requested to list others 
Ask directors, or leader where there 

work out ordering details See WMU

rials

To: Directors
WMS
YWA 
GA
Sunbeam Band

is on the WMU
council come

into the

council: the concerns of and poten­
tial for her area of work or the age 
group which she represents; specific 
ideas and resources for integrating 
such knowledge and understanding 
into the total program of Woman’s 
Missionary Union. Each person 
should also come with an openness 
to other phases of work being pro­
posed and help the members of the 
council become unified in its "total 
program" approach.

What can you as a director do to 
make your participation on the 
council meaningful to you and help­
ful to others?

1 Come with full knowledge of 
work which has been done the past 
month in all the age-level organiza­
tions for w’hich you are responsible.

2. Be prepared to give the high­
lights of that work. This may be a 
written or oral report, but it should 
be prepared.

3 Adequately represent the or­
ganizations w’hich you direct Share 
the interests and concerns of the 
leaders. Make requests for leaders, 
leadership training, facilities, fi­
nances. materials and supplies or 
any other needs which they might

4 Be informed about the overall 
program of WMU Read The WMU 
Leader each month for plans which 
are suggested and ways to imple­
ment those plans

5 Be informed about the work of 
the church Read the church bulletin 
or newsletter, listen to announce­
ments. participate in meetings at the 
point at which you are involved to 
keep abreast of the total church pro­
gram and WMU's relationship to it.

6 Come ready to participate in 
the discussion and the decision mak­
ing

Materials Checklist

Check the following basic mate­
rials which are available for age­
level leaders These materials should
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ut Pluup/t
On September 1, 1845, S. C. Clopton became the tint 

Southern Baptist foreign missionary. His appointment to China 
opened the first Southern Baptist foreign missions field. Mis-

May 1970 marks the 125th Anniversary of the Southern 
Baptist Convention. Meeting in Augusta, Georgia, in May 
1845, delegates from southern churches acknowledged the 
disunity within the Triennial Convention by drafting a con­
stitution for a new convention of southern churches. Wishing 
to retain the missionary imperative of the Triennial Conven­
tion, both a Board of Foreign Missions and a Board of Do­
mestic Missions were created. The Board of Foreign Missions 
was located at Richmond. Virginia, and the Board of Domestic 
Missions was located at Marion, Alabama.

October, November, and December have been designated 
special months of prayer beginning the 125th anniversary year 
of home and foreign missions

sionaries to China were followed by missionaries to Liberia, 
Nigeria, Japan, Italy, Brazil, and Mexico in the remaining 
years of the nineteenth century.

By 1846, 1. T. Hinton had been appointed missionary pastor 
of the First Baptist Church of New Orleans. This appointment 
followed the instruction of the Southern Baptist Convention 
that the Board of Domestic Missions direct its attention to the 
establishment of Baptist work in New Orleans. Two other 
missionaries were sent to Texas to work in the rapidly de­
veloping western territory By I860 every southern and 
southwestern state, the Indian territory, and the west coast 
had home missionaries.

From these beginnings the Foreign Mission Board has grown 
to over 2.500 missionaries in approximately seventy countries. 
The Home Mission Board currently has over 2,300 mission­
aries in fifty states. District of Columbia. Panama. Puerto 
Rico. Western Cuba, and Canal Zone

Consider these special requests this month:

Express gratitude for those men who shaped the early 
foundations of the Home and Foreign Mission Boards

Express gratitude for those men and women who were 
the early home and foreign missionaries Pause to consider 
the groundwork constructed by these persons for current mis­
sions advance

Express gratitude tor the funds given by Southern Bap­
tists to develop the work of world missions

Consider with awe the intricate design of human events 
used by God to fulfil his missionary purpose

Petition God s grace for leadership in the formation of 
future home and foreign missions plans

CALL TO PRAYER
■ “ ■ North Brozil
* “ ‘ Mrs R T Bowlin, furlough, Rhodesia 

Von Worten, furlough, Indonesia
■ m . F M Cossidy. retired. Virginia
•~F Bertis Fair. retired. North Carolina

5 SUNDAY Reed Eiekiel 11:13-21
Pray tho’ notional Christians on all of

and wisdom to meet the opposition that
often comes from family ond friends who
do not understand decisions that are made

Petition for an adequate number of missions candidates 
to fulfil these plans

Pray for the growth of notional Christian 
leadership m rhe task of witnessing for 
Christ among their own people

Proy for James L Benson worker among 
Spanish Texas

Charles Brashear superintendent of mis­
sions Ohio

Mrs Johnnie P Coffey worker among

Petition for receptivity on the part of persons to whom 
ministry is directed

Petition for necessary funds to earn on the missions en­
terprise.

Negroes Oklohomo
M<s Rofoel de Armos metropolitan mis­

sions. Florido
Mrs Robert Gross mission center New

Mexico
Phyllis Hole US 2 Michigon
Thomas Lowe worker among Chinese,

Commit your Ide to deeper discipleship

Commit your mind to greater study of the modern mis­
sionary movement

Commit your emotions to prayerful desire for the hope 
of missions.

Commit your resources to greater fulfilment of the mis­
sions task.

Ma lays io

Douglas Kendall, publication work, Zambia 
Donald Mason, student work, Zambia 
Mrs C. T. Stephens, home and church 

work, Indonesia
Mrs J D. Harrod, furlough, Equatorial 

Brazil
Mrs D H. Redmon, furlough, Costa Rico 
Mrs Lillian Robertson, retired, Louisiana.

4 MONDAY Reed faeklel 26:26-31.
In the lost year the thirty members of 

the Baptist church of Puntorenas, Costa 
Rica, hove built on addition to their small 
building and have started two preaching 
points Pray that other churches in Costa 
Rica will take advantage of every opportu­
nity to build ond strengthen their work

Proy for Jerry F Potter, worker among 
deaf. North Carolina

Mrs Lee D Grubb, mission center, Penn­
sylvania

Helen Stuart, worker among Spanish, Canol

Zone
| [ Ballenger, preaching ministry, Ger­

many
Donold Doyle, preaching ministry. Costa

Rico
Ruth Ann Hall, medico! work, Nigeria
Mrs D L Hill, home and church work, 

Philippines
Mrs C T Hopkins, home ond church work.

Nigeria
Charles Io Grone radio television ministry, 

Argentina
Mrs W W Lawton, home ond church 

work Taiwan
Gerald Riddell, preaching ministry, Chile 
Mrs J A Williams, home ond church

work Mexico
Mrs D M Lawton, furlough. Taiwan 

7 TUESDAY Reed Denial 1:1-21.
A young man prayed in Malaga Baptist 

Church Lord, what is truth? Show me the 
truth According to Dorothy (Mrs H W > 
Schwemsberg, Malaga, Spam, many young 
people come doily to osk whot Baptists be 
beve Proy that they will understand the 
message ond literature they receive, and 
continue seeking until they know that 
Christ is Truth and the only Saviour

Pray for Mrs Lowell F Lawson Chris 
tion social ministries. Kentucky

Donald Justin Rollins, pastoral missionary 
Alaska

C Bollord White, worker among Indians.
South Dakota

Mrs P M Anderson home ond church 
work. Philippines

Mrs M J Ledbetter, home ond church 
work Mexico

tames Lunsford preaching ministry South 
Brazil

Mrs B R Murray, home ond church work 
Peru

Mrs H W Schweinsberg home and church 
work. Spam

Mn. H. T. Sufton, dormitory parent, Ni­
geria

Marie Von Lear, educational work, Nigeria 
Harold Renfrow, furlough, South Brazil.

1 WEDNESDAY Heed Daniel 2:12-21.
Building Christian schools is on impor­

tant task on any missions field. These 
schools provide on unending source of con­
tact with non-Christ io ns ond a training 
ground for national leadership. Proy for 
these institutions ond their missionary and 
national faculties.

Pray for Magnus V Gonnsen, worker 
among Indians, northern US

Mrs John E. Hubbard, worker among In­
dians, New Mexico

Mrs James Nelson, worker among Indians, 
New Mexico

Anne Prince, US-2, Louisiana
Judy Adams, medical work, Nigeria
Mrs J E Mills, home and church work. 

West Africa
Mrs J F Spann, home ond church work. 

North Brazil
Mrs J E Tolar, home ond church work, 

Nigeria

» THURSDAY Reed Denial 4:10-23
Many thousands of international stu­

dents study each year in colleges ond uni­
versities in the United States The moiority 
of these students ore non-Christion Pray 
that Christian students, faculty members, 
ond church families will extend the fellow 
ship of the church to international Stu 
dents Pray that the international students 
may recognize Christian hospitality to be 
the outgrowth of love

Pray for Mrs Eugene Sloan, worker 
among Spanish, Oklahoma

Lloyd K Spencer, superintendent of mis 
sions, Illinois

Barbara Corley, educational work, Thai 

land
Harold Garrett preaching ministry Philip 

pines
Dorothy Lotham. social work, Equatorial 

Brazil
Mrs F D Stull home and church work

Ch.le
Karin Young, religious education work,

Kenya
Jimmie Hooten furlough, Ugondo 

10 FRIDAY Reed Ho»«« 6:1-11.
Every missionary parent must foce the 

time when children return to the United 
States for college study Pray for families 
who are experiencing this separation cur 
rentlv Proy that these students will rapidly 
adjust to American college life and de 
velop meaningful reloftansh.ps tn o local 
church

Pray for Clyde Rockett pioneer missions.
Puerto Rico

Frank M. Chase, pioneer missions, Rhode 
Island

James Cecil, business administration, Hong 
Kong

Mn. T. E. Douthit, home and church work,
Korea

Mrs. W. M. Gorrott, home and church 
work, Japan

George Hoys, educational work, Japan
Franklin Mitchell, preaching ministry, 

Chile
Loyd Moon, educational work. Equatorial 

Brazil
Mn. D B Ray, home ond church work, 

Korea
Mrs J B Slock, furlough, Philippines
Mrs Ricordo B Alvarez, retired, Texas

11 SATURDAY Reed Jeel 2:21-22.
Although congregations in East Germany 

ore allowed to meet within their own 
church buildings, they ore severely restrict­
ed in advertising and promotion, writes 
Lewis Krause, missionary in West Ger­
many Building permits to renew or re­
model out-doted ond rundown facilities ore 
virtually impossible to obtain Pray for the 
Christians who work out their discipleship 
in these limited circumstances

Pray for Mrs Frank Mendez, worker 
among Spanish, Colorado

Jesse Bryan, preaching ministry, Spain
T C Hamilton, educational work, Philip­

pines
Lewis Krouse, preaching ministry, Germany
Oren Robison, preaching ministry, Nigeria 
Jone Yates, nurse, Gaza
Mrs J T Adams, furlough, Tanzania
Walton Chambless, furlough, Mexico
Mrs A G Dunaway, furlough. Nigeria

12 SUNDAY Reed John 2:1-11.
An increasingly large number of persons 

ore turning to Christ in Indonesia Proy 
for the spiritual training of these new 
Christians, their notional pastors, and for 
the growth of their churches toward self 
support Students serve under Baptist semi­
nary supervision in evangelistic work in 
central Java Numerous centers of church 
work have developed from this ministry 
Pray for these students who will be the 
future Baptist leaders m Indonesia

pray ior Mrs Edmon Burgher. Jr , work 
er among Russians. California

Mary C Page Baptist center, Illinois 
Herbert Edminster educational work, Rho

desia
Robert Holifield, preaching ministry, Italy 
Mrs A L Hood, home ond church work,

Thailand
Mrs D W Moore, home and church work,

Ghana
Mrs R A Morris home and church work, 

Singapore
Mrs H L Shoemake, home and church
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work, Dominican Republic
Mrs. G. E. Tyner, home and church work, 

Philippines
Samuel Simpson, furlough, Ecuador

13 MONDAY Reed John 4:1-10.
"In trusting Lord Christ," Surender Gup­

ta exclaims, "I find a new complexion to 
all of existence, the ugly, mundane things 
of life " Proy that this college student with 
I background of Hinduism will be able to 
each many international students with his 

contagious witness
Pray also for Choo Lim, a £iMgaporean 

convert from Buddhism, encountering pa­
rental scorn for her desertion of the ances­
tral faith. Proy that other international 
students will be willing to endure the some 
struggles for Christ

Proy for Eva Marie Kennard, work among 
international students, California

Esperanza Ramirez, Spanish kindergarten 
work, Texas

Jerry G St John, worker omong deof, 
Mississippi

Carolyn Anderson, social work, Vietnam 
Nancy Goodyear, educational work, Nigeria 
Richard Henderson, educational work,

Philippines
Mrs H H Holley, home and church work, 

Malaysia
Mrs V L Moore, home and church work. 

Malaysia
Carter Morgan, educational work, Hong 

Kong
Mrs B L Nichols, home and church work, 

Indonesia
Mrs 0 J Quick, home and church work, 

Taiwan
Evelyn Schwartz, religious education work, 

Indonesia
Mrs R H Stuckey, home ond church 

work, Indonesia
Mrs P J Tcherneshoff. home and church 

work, South Brazil
Elizabeth Truly educational work. Nigeria 
Mrs G S Williamson, home and church 

work, Mexico
Mrs J W Gardner retired. Texas

14 TUESDAY Read John 4:19-30.
Baptists of the Netherlands held an 

evangelistic campaign in March 1969 
Pray for those persons who mode decisions 
Pray that they might be reminded of this 
peak of spiritual energy m their lives ond 
draw from this remembrance strength to 
live more deeply committed lives

Pray for Donold Nicholson postoral mis 
sionary. Oregon

James H Shope, superintendent of mis 
sions, Kansas

Mrs C B Baker, home and church work.

Mrs D L Baker, home and church work,

Martha Ann Blount, religious education

work. South Brazil
Mrs. G. B. Cowsert, home ond church work, 

South Brazil
Kenneth Evenson, publication work, Baptist 

Spanish Publishing House, El Paso, Texas
Mrs. 0. W Gwynn, home ond church work, 

Equatorial Brazil
Mrs. T. O. High, home and church work, 

Nigeria
Mrs W C Hunker, home and church work.

Taiwan
Mrs D M Simms, home and church work, 

Guatemala
Boyd Sutton, music ministry. South Brazil
Mrs S D Clark, furlough, Argentina

15 WEDNESDAY Reed John 4:31-42.
New foreign missionaries experience a 

sixteen-week period of orientation directed 
by the Foreign Mission Board During this 
time, they learn something of mission strot 
egy, principles of group interaction, and 
basic missionary skills They hove time to 
rethink their missionary coll and to draw 
strength from the unfolding pion for their 
lives Pray that these might be beneficial 
days for those involved in missionary orien­
tation

Pray for Albert Bell, US-2. New York 
Victor L Nichols, juvenile rehabilitation,

Gordon D Thomas, pastoral missionary,

Luther L Richardson rural urban work,
California

Mrs J C Bridges home and church work 
Mexico

Mrs R C Hensley home and church work 
Bahamas

Carol Henson educational work Chile 
Bob Hunt student work Taiwan
Bob Teems, preaching ministry French

West Indies
Otis Brody furlough Guyona
Martha Hagood, furlough Nigeria
Mildred Lovegren furlough Hong Kong 
Mrs G R Wilson furlough Hong Kong 
J F Plainfield retired South Carolina

16 THURSDAY Read John 6:5-14
A recent convert to Christ from Bud 

dhism was taking part m a Buddhist dance 
in which the dancers donced in a circle 
believing the spirits of their dead relatives 
danced with them When questioned by 
the missionary the student responded I 
don't believe those things it is just fun to 
me Pray that recent converts might leorn 
to discriminate between actions that con 
be retained in their new Christian freedom 
and those forms of behavior which are now 
inconsistent

Pray for Freddie Mae Boson Baptist 
center Georgia

Mrs Curtis Boland worker among Spanish 
Californio

Muri Platt worker among Negroes Louisi

ano
Mrs. W. J. Blair, publication work, Baptist 

Spanish Publishing House, El Paso, Texas
John Carpenter, preaching ministry, Li­

beria
Hubert Hardy, preaching ministry, Chile
Mrs. E B. Kimler, home and church work 

Venezuela
Mrs H. E Spencer, home and church work 

Philippines
Mrs R F Stormer, home and church work 

Italy
C W Stumph, retired. New Mexico.

17 FRIDAY Reed John 6:22-35.
Many decisions for Christ hove been 

made during the Crusade of the Americas. 
Proy thot Christians involved in this Cru­
sade will continue to work with enthusiasm 
at the tosk of evangelism Proy that ode- 
quote follow-up be mode with each Crusode 
contact Proy that those converted in this 
ministry will find useful ways of relating 
themselves to the continuing spread of the 
Crusade message

Pray for Charles Hancock. Christian so­
cial ministries, Californio

Mrs Tom Prevost, US 2, Idaho
Mrs C R Beord, home ond church work.

Taiwan
L R Brock, preaching ministry, North 

Brazil
Jomes Burnhom, preaching ministry, Eu­

rope-Middle East
Mrs J D Carter, home and church work. 

North Brazil
Mrs T E Cromer, home ond church work,

Mrs 5 M Jomes home and church work,

Mrs J K Pork home ond church work.
Chile

Mrs F C Porker home ond church work.
Jopon

Don Reece preochmg ministry Nigeria 
Ray Shelton preaching ministry Uruguay 
W A Solesbee. religious educo'ion work

Philippines
Diane Williams religious education work

Edward Sanders, furlough Indonesia 
Mrs Isoios Voldiva retired. Texas

18 SATURDAY Read John 6 53-68
Europe is m a state of change The fast 

pace of Western modernization scientific
advancement and space oge technology 
ore cousing old foundations to be shaken

sionories m Europe mov be guided to use 
these changing factors to hasten revival 
Pros that they may hove insight rc utilize 
new approaches to the communication of 
Christ s command

Pray for Mrs Carte' Bearden worker

among deaf, Georgia
Henry E Hardin, worker among Negroes, 

South Carolina
Major V Mean, superintendent of mis­

sions, Arizona
Mrs. D. P Daniell, home and church work, 

Mexico
Byron Harbin, educational work, Hong 

Kong
James Leeper, English-languoge work, Tur­

key
Jock Martin, preaching ministry, Thailand 
Merrill Moore, doctor, Gaza
Wendell Page, preaching ministry, French

West Indies
Mrs J A Yarbrough, home ond church 

work, Nigeria.

19 SUNDAY Reed John 7:31-37.
The Middle East is torn by resentment, 

pride, hate, ond strife Arob notions ore 
predominantly Muslim, Israel is Jewish 
Both religions believe in God. the Creator, 
both reject Christ os God s son and Saviour 
of the world Pray for peace and under 
standing between those nations Pray thot 
they will be taught the responsibility and 
freedom that peace demands

Pray for Dione Green, US-2, Kentucky 
Mrs Hazel W Scarlett, evangelistic work,

Panama
David B Warren, worker among Indians.

Ok lahomo
Ronald Fuller, preaching ministry, Vietnam 
James Houser, educational work. Kenya 
C W McClelland, English-language work,

Rhodesia
Henry Wolf, furlough, Mexico
Mrs W B Sherwood, retired. Brazil

20 MONDAY Reed John 8:12-19
Southern Baptist missions work began in 

Nigeria in 1850 We now hove mission­
aries in fifteen African countries Some of 
these ore newly independent countries with 
the instability inherent in the process of 
developing on independent notion Proy 
for the leaders of these notions as they 
mold forms of government ond provide for 
national interests Pray that United States 
relations with these countries will be peace 
•ui ond instructive in the study of the 
democratic process

Proy for Mamie Nell Booker Baptist 
center Louisiana

Mrs L C Bell, home ond church work 
Portugal

Mrs J C Colhoun home and church work 
Thailand

Lowrey Cooper, preaching ministry Argen

Lotete Dotson, nurse. Nigeria
Mrs J L Moon, home and church work 

Equatorial Brazil
Mrs W I Page, home ond church work, 

f'ench West Indies
Edgor Thorpe preaching ministry, Hong

Kong
Doris Knight, retired, Chino, Manchuria, 

Nigeria.

21 TUESDAY Reed Jehu 8:28-40.
"People visit our home daily inquiring 

about the beginning of our hospital," write 
the Charles Becketts, East Pakistan. With 
physical needs, illnesses, deformities, and 
obvious pain thot cannot be overlooked, 
these people beg for attention Pray thot 
Dr Beckett will be granted the legal per­
mit necessary to treat such persons of East 
Pakistan. East and West Pakistan are in 
great need physically ond spiritually Pray 
for others to answer God's coll to both 
areas of Pakistan.

Pray for Eunice Heath, Baptist center, 
Tennessee

Ruby Miller, evangelistic work, Florida 
Sidney Smith, metropolitan missions. Cali­

fornio
Hilorio Voldes, evangelistic work, Virginia 
Mrs C A Beckett home and church work,

Pakistan
Mrs E E Brown, home and church work, 

Bahamas
Mrs H A Brown, home ond church work 

Nigeria
Annie Hoover, religious education work 

Japan
Mrs W P Malone, home ond church 

work, Argentina
Grady Nowell, preaching ministry. Hon 

duras
Corrie Bockelmon, retired, Georgia

22 WEDNESDAY Read John 9:1-9
A new community development program 

is emerging in Ethiopia Missionaries will 
teach vocational training os well as mod 
ern methods of farming Pray that through 
their efforts to communicate concern for 
the total person missionaries may persuade 
Ethiopians of the wisdom of the gospel

Pray for Nino Gillespie worker among 
Chinese. Arizona

R W Perry, teacher missionary. South
Carolina

Mrs H B Harbin home and church work
Hong Kong

Mrs S C Jowers, home and church work
Philippines

Mrs A S Morgrett educo’iono1 work
Argentina

Mrs R B Robertson home and church 
work. Mexico

Mrs W A Solesbee home and church 
work Philippines

Mrs J H Teel home and church work 
Pok istan

Mrs V 0 Vernon home and church work 
South Brazil

John Virkler religious education work 
Bermuda

Mrs T J Kennedy, furlough Niger 10 
Hubert Tatum, furlough Hawaii

George Wilson, furlough, Hong Kong.

23 THURSDAY Reed Jehu 9:24-3*.
South American cities ore filled with 

people who have moved from the interior 
of the country. Cut off from home environ­
ment, they try desperately to adjust to city 
life. Pray for the adjustment of these 
uprooted individuals. Pray thot the circum­
stances of these moves might give mission­
aries a new channel of communication.

Pray for Mrs C J Kraus, worker among 
French, Louisiana

Mrs Spurgeon Swinney, mission center, 
Virginia

Webster Carroll, preaching ministry, Ugan­
da

Wilfred Congdon, construction work, Ni­
geria

Josephine Harris, student work, Hawaii 
Pomelo Kelley, nurse, Rhodesia
Bertie Kendrick, religious educational work, 

Hawaii
Donald Laing, publication work, South 

Brazil
Donold McDowell, doctor, Paraguay
Joseph Newton, preaching ministry, Mo­

rocco
Mrs H L Stevens, educational work, 

Mexico
Mrs B R Lowton. furlough, Italy
Mrs R M Wright, furlough, Korea
Isoios Bast, retired, Texas
Mrs Elios Delgado, retired, California

24 FRIDAY Reed John 10:24-38.
Baptist missions work in Latin America 

includes twenty one countries from Mexico 
to Argentina There are approximately 235 
million jieople sjyeaking mainly the Spanish 
ond Portuguese languages Proy for the 
missionaries and notional Baptist leaders 
as they lead in follow up programs ond the 
training of converts from Crusode of 
Americas in thot continent

Pray for Dolton Hoggan. worker omong 
Indians Mississippi

Michael Naranjo, worker omong Indians, 
New Mexico

Mrs D L Ba’emqn home and church 
worker Kenya

David Coleman, business administration,
Nigeria

Charles Dickson, educational work. North

Mrs L R Brothers, furlough Nigeria 
T 5 Green furlough. Argentina 
John Merritt, furlough, holy 
Mrs Moises Gonzalez, retired. Cuba 
Buren Johnson retired, China, Indonesia
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Mrs, W B Johnson, retired, China, Indo­
nesia

B W. Orrick, retired, Uruguay

25 SATURDAY Reed Job" 11:41-52.
Medicol missions work has two major 

ministries, teaching the way of salvation 
and healing physical and mental diseases 
In the Middle East missions hospitals have 
been the opening through which other mis­
sions work has entered The training of 
national nurses is a most effective result 
of missions hospitals Pray for this healing 
ministry, for the missionaries, for national 
doctors ond nurses

Pray for Pedro Arrombide, worker among 
Spanish, Texas

James Bowen, worker among Indians, New 
Mexico

Mrs Charles Brasheor, superintendent of 
missions, Ohio

Mrs J D Land, mission center, Ohio
Lowell F Lawson. Christian social minis­

tries, Kentucky
Jess E Dittmar, urban work, Indiana
Robert L Smith, pioneer missions, Penn 

sylvoma
Joel C Pistone worker among Spanish, 

California
Russell Morris, Student work. Singapore
John Parker, preaching ministry, Chile
Margaret Pemble, social work. Equatorial

Brazil
Mrs V W Chombless furlough Mexico
Mrs H W Lewis, furlough, Trinidad
Mrs P H Pierson, retired. Texas

26 SUNDAY Read John 12:20-32.
To print the Christian message in the 

language of the people is one of the great 
est tasks of missions work Bibles ond gos 
pel tracts awoken minds causing people 
to seek Christ Baptists support twenty 
seven publication centers on foreign mis 
sions fields Pray for those persons who 
translate the Scriptures that they might 
hove alert minds Pray for those who par 
ticipote m the technical process of print 
mg Prov for those who read the B'bles

Proy for Alvin Kenneth Chadwick work 
er among Spanish. Texas

John Alfred Cooper worker among dec* 
Indiana

Charles Campbell radio TV ministry Thai 
land

Jomes W Hatley worker among Spanish,

Jerry L Scruggs, Christian social ministries. 
New York

James Brandon preaching ministry South 
Brazil

Mrs M P Calloway nurse Yemen
Edward Dosher doctor Nigeria

J. G. Goodwin, radio-television ministry, 
Korea

Worth Grant, publication work, Japan
Ervin Hastey, preaching ministry, Mexico
Delbert Toy lor, preaching ministry, Co­

lombia
Mrs J L Bice, retired, Brazil.

27 MONDAY Read John 13:31-38.
Spanish Baptists plan to enter every city 

in Spain of 100,000 inhabitants or more 
with the gospel This strategy is based on 
the possibility that people in the cities ore 
freer to make independent decisions than 
those in rural areas Pray for missionaries 
in Spam os they attempt new forms of 
ministry

Proy for Mrs Eddie Sovoie, worker 
among French, Louisiana

Valerio Sherord. evangelistic work, Alaska 
R E Amis, doctor, Nigeria
Lowry Mallory, educational work, Kenya 
William Malone preaching ministry, Ar 

gentmo
Evelyn Stone educational work Ghana 
Mrs S T Tipton home and church work.

Uganda
Charles Wisdom, student work. Mexico 
Olive Allen furlough. Thailand 
Bobby Evons, furlough, Malaysia
Oliver Gilliland, furlough, Indonesia 
Mrs T E Savage, furlough Zombie

28 TUESDAY Reed Jotin 14:1-14
Radio and TV hove become popular ond 

effective means of communicating the 
Christian message to the world Radio pro 
grams recently begun by the Arab Baptist 
Mission in Beirut Lebanon hove resulted 
m many inquiries, hundreds of people loin
mg correspondence Bible courses and sev 
era I conversions Proy that missionaries
involved in rodiO and TV ministries moy 
have creative ideas for new programs Pray 
tho' listeners be mode receptive to current 
broadcasts

Pray for Everlev Hayes nurse Indonesia
Wondo Ponder nurse Paraguay
Mrs R W Terry home and church work 

Germany
Mrs C G Tabor furlough Korea

29 WEDNESDAY Read John 14 15-24
The Zambia Baptist Crusade will take 

place m 19 70 The Baptists of Zambia 
hove been making pions for this Crusade 
for three years Evangelists ond musicians 
from America will come to help in this wit 
ness Revivals will be held m the cities and 
m the rural areas Pray that God will bless 
this coming crusade thot revival might 
come to Zambia

Proy for Mrs C D Bilbary home and 
church work Guyana

John Cove educational work Argent mo 
Robert Compher preaching ministry Vie*

David Miller, preaching ministry. North
Brazil

R L. Stocks, furlough, Zambia
Josephine Ward, retired, China, Taiwan.

30 THURSDAY Reed Jet. 11:12-37.
Early in 1969 the future seemed brighter 

for Czechoslovakian Baptists than it hod 
for many years. With five new church 
buildings planned ond the right for Baptist 
ministers to preach regained, Czechoslo- 
vakian Baptists were optimistic Pray thot 
religious liberty will increase in this coun­
try

Pray for Claude N Roy, superintendent 
of missions, Michigan

Chorleeda Bennett, educational work 
Korea

Horry Byrd, preaching ministry, Guatemala 
Margaret Fairburn, worker with women, 

Liberia
Mrs R B Hilliard, home ond church work. 

Spam
Francis Lewis, educational work. Indonesia 
Thomas Norman, preaching ministry, Co­

lombia
Mrs J W Richardson, doctor, Nigeria 
Mrs J O Teel, home ond church work,

Argentina
Rebekah Lambert, furlough, Korea 
J W Gardner, retired. Texas
J W McGovock. retired. Chile
Hannah Plowden, retired, Chino, Hawaii

31 FRIDAY Reed John 16:1-14.
One Sunday night in Lisbon, Portugal.

church members were surprised ond some­
what worried when a reporter and a pho­
tographer from one of the Lisbon papers 
visited the service The visitors watched
with care the order of service, including 
the ordinance of baptism To everyone's 
surprise the Monday paper featured a 
picture story of the baptismal service Proy 
that the innate curiosity of persons living 
near missions churches will lead them to o 
confrontation with the gospel message

Pray for Mamie K Cobamss. Baptist 
center Louisiana

Jerry W Humble US 2 Virginia
Amta Coleman educational work, Japan
Charles Maddox business administration, 

Ghana
Mrs C L Mille' home and church work, 

Philippines
Buford Nichols educational work Indo-

Sophia Nichols worker with women South 
Braz'1

Mrs A B Olive’ home and church work. 
South Brazil

Mrs G C Tennison home and church 
work Portugo1

lames Johnston furlough Nigeria
Mrs S S S’over retired Brazil
Mrs W J Webb retired Mexico Guate­

mala Venezuela

"Seal Ua, O Holy Spirit”

Hytnn of the Year

Available from Woman's Missionary Union,

dozen copies for 25 cents

Seal us

for service
. <7 ' S--S ■ MM* Illi Ik.. . V . ■ -jr-.'.
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Dean Poster,
We hope the WMU of your church has done careful homework 

and will show up particularly well in this church year of 1969-70 
In some churches. Woman's Missionary Societies have discovered 
that they need an additional officer and assistant group leaders to 
administer their WMS program In WMS Forecaster, pages 33-36 
of this magazine, we arc offering suggestions helpful to those who 
may wish to make these administrative changes in 1969-70 Please 
urge your WMS president and other leaders to read the suggestions

Urge the WMU in your church to elect a different woman to 
serve as WMU director from the one serving as WMS president 
Last year tn some churches a woman served as WMU director- 
WMS president This is not good The responsibility is too heavy 
for one person The responsibility of leading the WMU council and 
serving on the church council allows little time for administering 
the WMS program In addition, confusion is created by the double 
terminology The state WMU and our office need to have the 
name of a WMU director We want to correspond with her. speak 
to her through special bulletins and letters We believe she will 
be a better representative for missions in your church if she can 
have an overview of all W ML work rather than the limited vision 
of one portion of that work

We feel that the WMU director is the key person for every 
church in our Convention—even the very small one where there 
is not yet a WMU organization We plan to write the pastors of 
churches with no WMU organizations this year asking that they 
begin by appointing or electing a WML director Then, we can 
send materials to her so that a church may observe the weeks of 
prayer and have mission study classes Prayerfully, we hope this 
will lead to organization, but we are more concerned that each 
church have someone to take the responsibility for missions em­
phases

As we look ahead to the nest twelve months we trust that they 
will be good ones for your church

Sincerely,

WMU Staff


